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FELAHY LAW GROUP, APC
Allen B. Felahy (SBN 190177)
Oscar Ramirez (SBN 236768)
Boris Sorsher (SBN 251718)
4000 Cover Street, Suite 100
Long Beach, California 90808
Phone: (562) 499-2121

Fax: (562)499-2124

Counsel for Plaintiff Sam Balooch

UNITED STATES DISTRICT COURT
NORTHERN DISTRICT OF CALIFORNIA
SAN JOSE DIVISION

In re APPLE iPHONE 4 PRODUCTS
LIABILITY LITIGATION

Master File No. 5:10-md-02188-RMW
CLASS ACTION

ALLEN FELAHY FILED ON BEHALF
OF FELAHY LAW GROUP, COUNSEL
OF RECORD FOR PLAINTIFF SAM
BALOOCH, IN SUPPORT OF AN
AWARD OF ATTORNEYS’ FEES AND
EXPENSES TO NON-LEAD COUNSEL

This Document Relates To:

)
)
|
) SUPPLEMENTAL DECLARATION OF
)
)
ALL ACTIONS. %
)

DATE: n/a
TIME: n/a
CTRM: The Honorable Ronald M. Whyte

SUPPLEMENTAL DECLARATION OF ALLEN FELAHY FILED ON BEHALF OF FELAHY LAW
GROUP, COUNSEL OF RECORD FOR PLAINTIFF SAM BALOOCH, IN SUPPORT OF AN AWARD OF
ATTORNEYS’ FEES AND EXPENSES
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I, Allen Felahy, declare as follows:

1. I am a member and Managing Partner of the firm of Felahy Law Group, APC
("Felahy Law Group"). I am submitting this supplemental declaration in support of my firm’s
application for an award of attorneys’ fees and expenses in connection with services rendered in

the above-entitled action, pursuant to the Court’s order of August 10, 2012.

2. The firm is counsel of record for plaintiff Sam Balooch. Our firm was not
appointed lead counsel in this consolidated MDL. I have not ever been paid or reimbursed any
fees or expenses in this case as of the filing of this document.

3. Since its inception in 1998, Felahy Law Group (formerly Felahy and Associates)
has aggressively litigated more than 1,000 cases in Southern California, and its employment and
business litigation attorneys pride themselves in standing at the top of their profession in terms of
skills, integrity, and rate of success, with an average trial/arbitration award in excess of
$250,000. The identification and background of my firm and its partners is as follows:

a. I am the founding partner of Felahy Law Group and I am admitted to
practice before all of the Courts of this State. I am highly experienced in civil litigation
and class actions practice. I have been practicing law since 1998 and have successfully
litigated numerous Federal and State law actions through trial. Indeed, my success as a
trial lawyer have been well documented in the Daily Journal, Los Angeles Times, Long
Beach Press Telegram, and other regional newspapers; as I have obtained substantial and
significant judgments/orders for my clients, several of which have exceeded the million
dollar threshold. Many of the aforementioned actions were multiparty or class action
wage and hour matters. Due to my expertise, 1 was invited to be a contributing editor to
the (2009-2010) CEB California Wage and Hour Compliance and Litigation Manual. I
accepted the invitation and edited a portion of that CEB guide. I have also successfully
certified numerous class action cases and have been found by state and federal judges
alike to be “qualified, experienced and generally able to conduct the proposed
litigation.”

SUPPLEMENTAL DECLARATION OF ALLEN FELAHY FILED ON BEHALF OF FELAHY

LAW GROUP, COUNSEL OF RECORD FOR PLAINTIFF SAM BALOOCH, IN SUPPORT OF
AN AWARD OF ATTORNEYS’ FEES AND EXPENSES -1-




10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25
26
27
28

Case5:10-md-02188-RMW Document81-5 Filed09/24/12 Page4 of 24

b. Oscar Ramirez is a partner of Felahy Law Group who is admitted to
practice before all of the Courts of this State. Mr. Ramirez is highly experienced in civil
litigation and class actions practice. Mr. Ramirez has been practicing law since 2005 and
has successfully litigated numerous Federal and State law actions through trial. Mr.
Ramirez is also a certified mediator. He serves as a volunteer mediator for the Los
Angeles Superior Court’s Alternative Dispute Resolution (ADR) program.

c. Mr. Joseph T. Sniezek, Esq., who is of counsel for Felahy Law Group, has
13 years of experience as an employment law attorney and has a proven track record of
success in complex multi-party employment law matters. Mr. Sniezek is admitted to
practice before all of the Courts of this State.

d. Mr. Boris Sorsher, has five years of litigation experience and has recently
been promoted to a junior partner. Mr. Sorsher has successfully litigated Federal and
State law actions through trial. Mr. Sorsher is admitted to practice before all of the Courts
of this State.

4. The following information regarding the firm’s time and expenses is taken from
time and expense printouts prepared and maintained by my firm in the ordinary course of
business. I am the attorney who oversaw and/or conducted the day-to-day activities in the
litigation and who reviewed these printouts (and backup documentation where necessary or
appropriate). The purpose of these reviews was to confirm both the accuracy of the entries on
the printouts as well as the necessity for and reasonableness of the time and expenses committed
to the litigation. As a result of these reviews, reductions were made to both time and expenses
either in the exercise of billing judgment or to conform to the firm’s guidelines and policies
regarding certain expenses such as charges for hotels, meals, and transportation. As a result of
these reviews and adjustments, I believe that the time reflected in the firm’s lodestar calculation
and the expenses for which payment is sought are reasonable in amount and were necessary for

the effective and efficient prosecution and resolution of the litigation.
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5. The total number of hours spent on this litigation by my firm is 150.50. The total
lodestar amount for attorney/paraprofessional time based on the firm’s current rates is
$59,647.50. The hourly rates shown below are the usual and customary rates charged for each

individual. A breakdown of the lodestar is as follows:

NAME HOURS | RATE LODESTAR
Allen B. Felahy (P) 56.70 | 495 $28,066.50
Oscar Ramirez (P) 37.50 | 395.00 $14,812.50
Boris Sorsher (A) 53.10 | 295.00 $15,664.50
Joseph T. Sniezek (0OC) 3.20 | 345.00 $1,104.00
TOTAL $59,647.50
(P) Partner
(A) Associate
(OC) Of Counsel
6. In light of the Court’s September 13, 2012, order I have attached hereto a true and

correct itemized bill for all services provided by my firm in this case. Pursuant to the Court’s
order this billing statement identifies both what services were performed and when those services
were provided. A true and correct copy of the billing statement is attached hereto as Exhibit 1.

7. As the Court will note, the attached billing statement demonstrates that a majority
of the fees and costs incurred were incurred before the appointment of lead counsel. However, a
certain amount of additional fees were incurred even after the appointment of class counsel
because my firm and I remained active in the litigation. Specifically, my firm and I continued to
monitor and review discovery requests propounded by the partiecs. We also reviewed and
commented on several sets of stipulations, proposed orders and proposed settlements. These

tasks resulted in additional fees which are reflected in the attached billing statement.
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8. In addition to fees, my firm seeks an award of $1,589.30 in expenses which were

reasonably and necessarily committed to the prosecution of the litigation. They are broken down

as follows:
EXPENSES
From Inception to May 21, 2012
EXPENSE CATEGORY TOTAL
Photocopies (in-house: 2170 copies @ $0.25 per page) $542.50
Postage & Delivery $141.80
Filing, Witness & Other Fees $£905.00
TOTAL $1,589.30
9. The following is additional information regarding certain expenses:
(a)  Filing, Witness and Other Fees: $905.00
DATE VENDOR
6/29/2010 One Legal LLC (complaint filing fee)
Amount : $905
10. The expenses pertaining to this case are reflected in the books and records of this

firm. These books and records are prepared from expense vouchers, check records and other
documents and are an accurate record of the expenses. In addition, all of the aforementioned
costs are included in the billing statement, a true and correct copy of which is attached hereto as
Exhibit 1.

11. I submit that the time and expense submission included in this Declaration were
incurred in this litigation. I request that the Court award my firm $59,647.50 in attorneys’ fees
and $1,589.30 in expenses reimbursement, for a total of $61,236.80.

I declare under penalty of perjury under the laws of the United States of America and the
State of California that the foregoing is true and correct. Executed this 19th day of September,
2012, at Long Beach, CA.

" ALLEN FELATIY; ESQ, Declarant
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Felahy Law Group, APC . STATE E NT

4000 Cover Street
Suite 100 DATE
Long Beach, CA 90808 a0

Tel. (562) 499-2121

| o

SAM BALOOCH

AMOUNT DUE
$61.236.80
DATE TRANSACTION QTY RATE AMOUNT BALANCE

06/23/2010 ABF MEETING WITH CLIENT 1 495.00 495.00 495.00
06/23/2010 ABF CONFERENCE RE: PRODUCT DEFECT 0.8 495.00 396.00 891.00
06/23/2010 OR CONFERENCE RE: PRODUCT DEFECT 0.8 395.00 316.00 1,207.00
06/23/2010 ABF PREPARED MEMORANDUM RE: 0.5 495.00 247.50 1,454.50

MEETING W/ CLIENT
06/24/2010 BSS REVIEW FACTS FOR PREPARATION 3 295.00 885,00 2,339.50

OF CLASS ACTION COMPLAINT;

PREPARED MEMO OF APPLICABLE

CAUSES OF ACTION
06/24/2010 ABF PREPARED MEMORANDUM OF L3 495.00 742.50 3,082.00

PRODUCT DEFECTS AND CAUSES OF
ACTION FOR COMPLAINT

06/24/2010 BSS RESEARCH INTENTIONAL AND 2 295.00 590.00 3.672.00
NEGLIGENT MISREPRESENTATION CAUSE
OF ACTION AND APPLICATION TO CLASS
CLAIMS

06/24/2010 BSS RESEARCH VIOLATION OF 3 295.00 885.00 4.557.00
CONSUMER LEGAL REMEDIES ACT AND
APPLICATION TO CLASS CLAIMS
06/24/2010 BSS RESEARCH BUSINESS AND 2.5 295.00 737.50 5,294.50
PROFESSIONS CODE SECTION 17200 AND
APPLICATION TO CLASS CLAIMS

061252010 | BSS DRAFTED CLASS ACTION 4.5 295.00 1,327.50 6,622.00
COMPLAINT
AMOUNT DUE
§61,236.80
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Felahy Law Group, APC STATE M E T

4000 Cover Street
Suite 100 DATE

Long Beach, CA 90808

4/24/2012
Tel. (562) 499-2121
! TO:
SAM BALOOCH
AMOUNT DUE
$61,236.80
DATE TRANSACTION QTY RATE AMOUNT BALANCE
06/25/2010 BSS REVIEWED MEMOS RE: CLASS 0.8 295.00 236.00 6.858.00
ACTION COMPLAINT AND MEETING W/
CLIENT
06/25/2010 BSS RESEARCH FALSE ADVERTISING 2.5 205.00 737.50 7.595.50
CAUSE OF ACTION AND APPLICATION TO
CLASS CLAIMS
06/25/2010 BSS RESEARCH BREACH OF IMPLIED 2.5 295.00 737.50 8,333.00

WARRANTY OF MERCHANTABILITY AND
APPLICATION TO CLASS CLAIMS

06/26/2010 JTS REVISED & EDITED COMPLAINT 2.5 345.00 862.50 9,195.50
06/27/2010 OR REVIEWED REVISED COMPLAINT; 1.5 395.00 592.50 9.788.00
CONFERENCE RE: FINAL EDITS

06/27/2010 BSS CONFERENCE RE: FINAL EDITS TO i 295.00 295.00 10,083.00
COMPLAINT; REVISED COMPLAINT

06/27/2010 BSS SUPPLEMENTED COMPLAINT W/ 2.2 295.00 649.00 10.732.00
ADDITIONAL RESEARCH

0672872010 BSS T/C TO CLIENT 0.2 295.00 59.00 10.791.00

06/28/2010 BSS PREPARED CORRESPONDENCE TO 0.2 295.00 59.00 10,850.00
CLIENT

06/28/2010 BSS CONFERENCE W/ JTS RE: CLASS 0.5 295.00 147.50 10,997.50
ACTION COMPLAINT

06/28/2010 BSS PREPARED CORRESPONDENCE TO 0.5 295.00 147.50 11,145.00
APPLE RE: DEFECTIVE PRODUCT

AMOUNT DUE
$61,236.80
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Felahy Law Group, APC
4000 Cover Street

STATEMENT

Suite 100 DATE
ng Beach, CA 90808
Long Beach, C 42412012
Tel. (562) 499-2121
] TO:
SAM BALOOCH
AMOUNT DUE
$61,236.80
DATE TRANSACTION QTy RATE AMOUNT BALANCE -
06/28/2010 | BSS CONFERENCE RE: COMPANY 0.2 29500 59.00 11.204.00
ADVERTISEMENTS
06/2872010 | BSS RESEARCH APPLE ADVERTISEMENT 2.5 295.00 737.50 11,941.50
06/28/2010 | BSS T/C TO CLIENT 0.2 295.00 59.00 12,000.50
06/2872010 | JTS CONFERENCE W/ BSS RE: CLASS 0.5 345.00 172.50 12.173.00
ACTION COMPLAINT
06/282010 | BSS PREPARED MEMO RE: COMPANY 1.5 295.00 442,50 12,615.50
ADVERTISEMENTS OF PRODUCT
06/29/2010 | FILING FEE PAYABLE TO COURT RE: 1 905.00 905.00 13,520.50
FILING OF SUMMONS & COMPLAINT FOR
CLASS ACTION LAWSUIT: ONE LEGAL
INVOICE #5002227
06/29/2010 | BSS CONFERENCE W/ ITS RE: COMPLAINT 0.2 295.00 59.00 13.579.50
FILING
06/29/2010 | BSS REVIEWED EMAIL RE: CLASS ACTION 0.2 295,00 59.00 13.638.50
SUITS
06/29/2010 | BSS REVIEWED MACRUMORS.COM 12 295.00 354.00 13.992.50
STORY POSTINGS: CONFERENCE RE:
STORIES
06/29/2010 | JTS CONFERENCE RE: COMPLAINT FILING 0.2 345,00 69.00 14.061.50
06/29/2010 | ABF REVIEWED MEMO RE: COMPANY 0.5 495.00 247,50 14,309.00
ADVERTISEMENT OF PRODUCT
06/29/2010 | FEE FOR MESSENGER SERVICE RE: FILING 1 63.35 63.35 1437235
OF SUMMONS & COMPLAINT
AMOUNT DUE
$61,236.80
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Felahy Law Group, APC
4000 Cover Street

STATEMENT

Suite 100 DATE
Long Beach, CA 90808
& ?C i 412412012
Tel. (562) 499-2121
i TO:
SAM BALOOCH
AMOUNT DUE
$61,236.80
DATE TRANSACTION QTY RATE AMOUNT BALANCE
06/30/2010 ABF TRAVEL TO/FROM SAN FRANCISCO 10 495.00 4.950.00 19,322.35
FOR MEETING W/ ENGINEERS
06/30/2010 ABF PREPARED MEMO RE: MEETING W/ 15 495.00 742.50 20,064.85
ENGINEERS
0770172010 BSS CONFERENCE RE: SUBMITTING 0.2 295.00 59.00 20.123.85
CLAIMS TO BLOGS
07/01/2010 BSS PREPARED COMPLAINT FOR SERVICE 0.5 295.00 147.50 20,271.35
ON OPPOSING COUNSEL
07/01/2010 ABF MEETING WITH CLIENT 1 495.00 49500 20,766.35
07/61/2010 ABF INDEPENDENT EVALUATION OF 2.5 495.00 1,237.50 22.003.85
PRODUCT
07/01/2010 ABF PREPARED MEMO CONCERNING 15 495.00 742.50 22,746.35
FINDINGS OF INDEPENDENT EVALUATION
AND RESEARCH
07/02/2010 BSS RESEARCH & REVIEW DEFECT 0.5 295.00 147.50 22,891 85
07/06/201C BSS REVIEWED CORRESPONDENCE FROM 0.2 295,00 59.00 22,952.85
OPPOSING COUNSEL
07/06/2010 BSS REVIEWED NOTICE OF RELATED 0.2 295.00 59.00 23.011.85
CASE
07/06/2010 BSS E-MAIL TO PROCESS SERVER RE; 0.2 295.00 59.00 23,070.85
SERVING COMPLAINT
07/06/2010 ABF REVIEWED RESEARCH CONCERNING 1.5 495.00 742.50 23,813.35
PRODUCT DEFECTS
AMOUNT DUE
$61,236.80
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Felahy Law Group, APC
4000 Cover Street

STATEMENT

Suite 100 DATE
g Beach, CA 90808
Long Bgach, , 4/24/2012
Tel. (562) 499-2121
TO:
SAM BALOOCH
AMOUNT DUE
$61,236.80
DATE TRANSACTION Qry RATE AMOUNT BALANCE
07/08/2010 | ABF REVIEWED RESEARCH CONCERNING 1.5 495.00 742.50 24,555 85
INCENTIVES FOR PRODUCT DEFECT
07/08/2010 | ABF REVIEWED CONSUMER REPORTS 2.5 495.00 1.237.50 25.793.35
EVALUATIONS OF PRODUCT
07/482010 | ABF REVIEWED PRESS ARTICLES RE: 05 495.00 247,50 26,040.85
RECEPTION PROBLEMS
07/09/2010 | FEE FOR MESSENGER SERVICE RE: 1 68.50 6%.50 26,109.35
SERVICE OF SUMMONS & COMPLAINT
07/12/2010 | BSS REVIEWED CONSUMER REPORTS 0.2 295.00 59.00 26,168,35
ARTICLES
07/12/2010 | BSS E-MAIL TO PARTNERS RE: 0.3 295.00 88.50 26,256.85
CONSUMER REPORTS
07/12/2010 | BSS CONFERENCE W/ PARTNERS RE: 0.8 295.00 236.00 26,492.85
CONSUMER REPORTS
07/12/2010 | BSS REVIEWED ARTICLE RE: CONSUMER 0.5 295,00 147.50 26,640.35
REPORTS RATING ON MACRUMORS
07/12/2010 | ABF CONFERENCE W/ BSS RE: CONSUMER 08 495,00 396.00 27,036.35
REPORTS
07/12/2010 | OR CONFERENCE W/ BSS RE: CONSUMER 0.8 395.00 316.00 2735235
REPORTS
07/13/2010 | BSS CONFERENCE RE: STATUS OF 0.2 295.00 59.00 2741135
SERVICE
07/14/2010 | BSS RESEARCH RE: SOFIWARE UPDATES 1.5 295.00 442.50 27.853.85
07/14/2010 | ABF MEETING WITH CLIENT i 495.00 495,00 78.348.85
AMOUNT DUE
$61,236.80
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Felahy Law Group, APC S?A?E E NT

4000 Cover Street
Suite 100 DATE

Long Beach, CA 90808

) 4/24/2012
Tel. (562) 499-2121
L TO:
SAM BALOOCH
AMOUNT DUE
$61,236.80
DATE TRANSACTION QTyY RATE AMOUNT BALANCE

07/14/2010 ABF REVIEWED RESEARCH RE: 0.5 495.00 247.50 28,596.35
SOFTWARE UPDATES

07/15/2010 ABF REVIEWED NEWS ARTICLE RE: 0.5 495.00 247.50 28.843.85
APPLE ENGINEERS

07/16/2010 BSS CONFERENCE RE: PRESS 0.5 295.00 147.50 28.991.35
CONFERENCE

07:16/2010 BSS REVIEWED RESULTS OF PRESS 0.8 295.00 236.00 29,227.35
CONFERENCE

07/16/2010 ABF REVIEWED WALL STREET JOURNAL Q.5 495.00 247.50 2947485
ARTICLE RE: APPLE KNOWLEDGE OF
PRODUCT DEFECT

07/16/2010 ABF REVIEWED MEMO RE: SUMMARY OF 0.5 495.00 247.50 29,722.35
PRESS CONFERENCE

07/19/2010 BSS REVIEWED COURT MINUTE ORDER 0.3 295.00 88.50 29.810.85
RE: RELATED CASES

07/19/2010 ABF REVIEWED COURT MINUTE ORDER 0.3 495.00 148.50 29,959.35
RE: RELATED CASES

07/29/2010 ABF REVIEWED NOTICE OF PAYMENT OF 0.2 495.00 99.00 30,058.35
FEES FROM DEFENDANT

08/04/2010 OR T/C FROM OPPOSING COUNSEL 0.2 395.00 79.00 30.137.35

0870472010 OR REVIEWED EMAIL FROM OPPOSING 0.1 395.00 39.50 30.176.85
COUNSEL RE: STIPULATION

AMOUNT DUE
$61,236.80
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Felahy Law Group, APC STAT E E N ?

4000 Cover Street
Suite 100 DATE

Long Beach, CA 90808
Tel. (562) 499-2121

472412012

[ T0:
SAM BALOOCH

AMOUNT DUE
$61,236.80
DATE TRANSACTION QTy RATE AMOUNT BALANCE

08/04/2010 OR REVIEWED PROPOSED STIPULATION 0.2 395.00 79.00 30,255.85
TO EXTEND TIME TO RESPOND TO
COMPLAINT

08/06/2010 BSS REVISED STIPULATION 0.5 295.00 147.50 30.403.35

08/06/2010 BSS SENT E-MAIL TO OR RE: 0.2 295.00 59.00 30,462.35
STIPULATION

08/06/2010 OR SENT E-MAIL TO OPPOSING COUNSEL 0.2 395.00 79.00 30.541.35
RE: STIPULATION

08/06/2010 ABF REVIEWED SIGNED STIPULATION 0.2 495.00 99.00 30,640.35
FROM OPPOSING COUNSEL

08/09/2010 BSS REVIEWED COURT 0.2 295.00 59.00 30.699.35
CORRESPONDENCE

08/09/2010 ABF REVIEWED MINUTE ORDER FROM 0.3 495.00 148.50 30.847.85
COURT RE NON-APPEARANCE STATUS
CONFERENCE

08/09/2010 OR REVIEWED MINUTE ORDER FROM 0.3 395.00 118.50 30,966.35
COURT RE NON-APPEARANCE STATUS
CONFERENCE

0870972010 OR PREPARED MEMORANDUM 1.5 395.00 592.50 31,558.85
CONCERNING DISCOVERY TO PROPOUND

08/10/2010 BSS CONFERENCE W/ OPPOSING 0.2 295.00 59.00 31.617.85
COUNSEL

AMOUNT DUE
$61,236.80
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Felahy Law Group, APC
4000 Cover Street

STATEMENT

Suite 100 DATE
Long Beach, CA 90808 412412012
Tel. (562) 499-2121
| 1o
SAM BALOOCH
AMOUNT DUE
$61,236.80
DATE TRANSACTION QTy RATE AMOUNT BALANCE
08/11/2016 | OR REVIEWED PROPOSED ORDER RE: 0.2 395.00 79.00 31,696.85
STIPULATION TO EXTEND TIME TO
RESPOND
08/11/2010 | BSS REVIEWED MEMO RE: DISCOVERY 0.5 295.00 147.50 31,844.35
TO PROPOUND
08/12/2010 | BSS RESEARCH FOR CLASS DISCOVERY 2 295.00 590.00 3243435
08/12/2010 | BSS DRAFTED REQUEST FOR 2.2 295.00 649.00 33,083.35
PRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS
08/16/2010 | BSS DRAFTED REQUESTS FOR 1.5 295.00 442.50 33,525.85
ADMISSIONS, SET ONE TO APPLE
08/16/2010 BSS DRAFTED FORM INTERROGATORIES, 0.5 295.00 147.50 33,673.35
SET ONE TO APPLE
0%/16/2010 | BSS PREPARED PROOF OF SERVICE FOR 0.2 295.00 59.00 33,732.35
DISCOVERY
08/16/2010 | ABF REVIEWED, REVISED AND EDITED 25 495 00 1,237.50 34,969.85
DISCOVERY REQUESTS
08/19/2016 | OR REVIEWED AND SIGNED REVISED 0.5 395.00 197.50 35,167.35
STIPULATION TO EXTEND TIME TO
RESPOND
08/19/2010 | OR CONFERENCE W/ ABF RE: LITIGATION 0.5 395.00 197.50 35.364.85
STRATEGY
08/19/2010 | ABF CONFERENCE W/ OR RE: LITIGATION 0.5 495.00 247.50 35,612.35
STRATEGY
AMOUNT DUE
$61,236.80
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Felahy Law Group, APC STATE , E N T

4000 Cover Street

Suite 100 DATE

Long Beach, CA 90808

41247012
Tel. (562) 499-2121
} TO:
SAM BALOOCH
AMOUNT DUE
$61,236.80
DATE TRANSACTION aty RATE AMOUNT BALANCE
0872372010 | OR SENT E-MAIL TO OPPOSING COUNSEL 05 395.00 197.50 35.509.85
RE: STIPULATION
082372010 | OR REVIEWED CASE EMAILS 02 395.00 79.00 35.888.85
08232010 | ABF REVIEWED SIGNED REVISED 03 495.00 148.50 36.037.35

STIPULATION AND PROPOSED ORDER RE:
EXTENDING TIME TO RESPONSD
0872372010 ABF REVIEWED DEFENDANT'S NOTICE OF 0.5 495.00 247.50 36,284.85
SUBMISSION OF PETITION FOR
COORDINATION AND APPLICATION FOR
STAY

08/2372010 OR REVIEWED DEFENDANT'S NOTICE OF 0.5 395.00 197.50 36.482.35
SUBMISSION OF PETITION FOR
COORDINATION AND APPLICATION FOR
STAY

08/23/2010 OR E-MAIL TO ZD RE: STIPULATION 0.3 395.00 118.50 36.600.85
08/2372010 ABF CONFERENCE W/ OR RE: IMPACT OF 0.5 495.00 247.50 36,848.35
COORDINATION AND STAY OF ACTION
08/2372010 OR CONFERENCE W/ ABF RE: IMPACT OF 0.5 395.00 197.50 37.045.85
COORDINATION AND STAY OF ACTION
08/25/2010 BSS REVIEWED OC CORRESPONDENCE 0.2 295.00 59.00 37.104.85
08/25/2010 ABF REVIEWED NOTICE OF UNOPPOSED 0.5 495.00 247.50 37,352.35
MOTION AND MOTION TO STAY PENDING
COORDINATION
AMOUNT DUE
$61,236.80
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Felahy Law Group, APC
4000 Cover Street

STATEMENT

Suite 100 DATE
Long Beach, CA 90808 ,
e 412412012
Tel. (562) 499-2121
| 0
SAM BALOOCH
AMOUNT DUE
$61,236.80
DATE TRANSACTION QTY RATE AMOUNT BALANCE
08/25/2010 | OR REVIEWED NOTICE OF UNOPPOSED 0.5 395.00 197.50 37,549.85
MOTION AND MOTION TO STAY PENDING
COORDINATION
09/07/2010 | BSS REVIEWED COURT DOCUMENTS 0.5 295.00 14750 37,697.35
09/47/2010 | ABF REVIEWED NOTICE OF ORDER RE: 0.2 495.00 99.00 37,796.35
COORDINATION MOTION
09/07/2010 | OR REVIEWED NOTICE OF ORDER RE: 0.2 395.00 79.00 37.875.35
COORDINATION MOTION
09/14/2010 | ABF REVIEWED NOTICE OF SUBMISSION 0.5 495.00 247.50 38.122.85
FROM THREE OTHER CLASS ACTION
CASES
09/14/2010 | ABF REVIEWED OTHER FILED CLASS 2.5 495.00 1.237.50 39.360.35
ACTIONS COMPLAINTS
09/20/2010 | ABF REVIEWED EMAIL FROM OPPOSING 0.3 495.00 148.50 39,508.85
COUNSEL RE: MOTION TO STAY
09/20/2010 | OR REVIEWED EMAIL FROM OPPOSING 0.2 395.00 79.00 39.587.85
COUNSEL RE: PENDING DISCOVERY
RESPONSES
09/22/2010 | ABF REVIEWED CORRESPONDENCE 0.2 495.00 99.00 39.086.85
FROM OPPOSING COUNSEL RE: STAY
09/2272010 | OR REVIEWED EMAIL FROM OPPOSING 0.2 395.00 79.00 39.765.85
COUNSEL RE: HEARING ON STAY; REPLY
TO EMAIL
AMOUNT DUE
$61,236.80
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Case5:10-md-02188-RMW Document81-5 Filed09/24/12 Pagel8 of 24

Felahy Law Group, APC STA?E E T

4000 Cover Street

Suite 100 DATE

Long Beach, CA 90808

472412012
Tel. (562) 499-2121
TO:
SAM BALOOCH
AMOUNT DUE
$61.236.80
DATE TRANSACTION QTyY RATE AMOUNT BALANCE

09/23/2010 ABF REVIEWED CORRESPONDENCE 0.5 495.00 . 247.50 40,013.35
FROM OC RE: MEET & CONFER
STATEMENT & MOTION TO STAY

09/23/2010 OR REVIEWED EMAIL FROM OPPOSING 0.5 395.00 197.50 40,210.85
COUNSEL RE: MEET & CONFER
STATEMENT

09/23/2010 OR REVIEWED DEFENDANT'S 0.3 395.00 118.50 40,329.35
STATEMENT RE: MOTION TO STAY

09/27/2010 ABF REVIEWED MEET & CONFER 0.3 495.00 148.50 40,477.85
STATEMENT RE: MOTION TO STAY

09/28/2010 ABF REVIEWED CORRESPONDENCE 0.3 495.00 148.50 40,626,35
FROM OC RE: RULING ON STAY

09/28/2010 OR REVIEWED EMAIL FROM OPPOSING 0.2 395.00 79.00 40,705 35
COUNSEL RE: COURT GRANTED STAY

10/0672000 ABF REVIEWED FILED JUDICIAL 0.3 495.00 148,50 40,853.85
COUNSEL COORDINATION PROCEEDING

10/07/2010 ABF REVIEWED FILED ORDER RE; 0.3 493 .00 148.50 41.002.35
ASSIGNMENT OF COORDINATION MOTION
JUDGE

10/08/2010 ABF REVIEWED ORDER SETTING 0.5 495.00 247.50 41,249.85
HEARING DATE; REVIEWED ORDER
GRANTING STAY

10/08/2010 OR REVIEWED ORDER SETTING HEARING 0.3 395.00 118.50 41,368.35
DATE ON COORDINATION PETITION

AMOUNT DUE
$61,236.80
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Felahy Law Group, APC
4000 Cover Street

Suite 100

Long Beach, CA 90808
Tel. (562) 499-2121

| To.

SAM BALOOCH

Pagel9 of 24

STATEMENT

DATE

4/24/2012

AMOUNT DUE

$61,236.80
DATE TRANSACTION QTY RATE AMOUNT BALANCE
1071472010 ABF REVIEWED NOTICE OF ORDER AND 0.3 495.00 148.30 41,516.85
SUBMISSION FROM OPPOSING COUNSEL
10/25/2010 BSS T/C FROM OPPOSING COUNSEL 0.2 295.00 59.00 41,575.85
10/29/2010 BSS REVIEWED COURT DOCUMENTS RE: 0.2 295.00 59.00 41.634.85
HEARINGS
110172010 BSS REVIEWED CLIENT FILE 0.5 295.00 147.50 41,782.35
110372010 BSS CONFERENCE RE: NOTICE OF STATUS 0.2 295.00 59.00 41,841.35
REPORT
11/0372010 BSS PREPARED NOTICE OF STATUS 0.5 295.00 147.50 41,988.85
REPORT
11/08/2010 BSS FILING OF E-FILE STATUS REPORT 0.3 295.00 8§8.50 42.077.35
11/0872010 ABF REVIEWED RETURNED NOTICE OF 0.3 495.00 148.50 42,225.85
STATUS REPORT AND ORDER SETTING
HEARING DATE
110572010 ABF REVIEWED FILED STATUS REPORT 0.2 495.00 99.00 42.324.85
11/09/2010 FEE FOR MESSENGER SERVICE RE: FILING 1 9.95 9.95 42.334.80
NOTICE OF STATUS REPORT, ONELEGAL
INVOICE #5016103
111572010 OR REVIEWED FILE IN PREPARATION FOR 0.8 395.00 316.00 42,650.80
STATUS CONFERENCE
1171572010 OR COURT APPEARANCE RE: STATUS 3 395.00 1,185.00 43,835.80
CONFERENCE
1171572010 BSS REVIEWED MEMO RE: HEARING; 0.5 295.00 147.50 43,983.30
PREPARED NOTICE OF RULING
AMOUNT DUE

Page 12
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Felahy Law Group, APC S?ATE E T

4000 Cover Street

Suite 100 DATE

Long Beach, CA 90808

2472012
Tel. (562) 499-2121
[ TO:
SAM BALOOCH
AMOUNT DUE
$61,236,80
DATE TRANSACTION QTY RATE AMOUNT BALANCE
11/16/2010 BSS FILING OF (EFILE) NOTICE OF RULING 0.2 295.00 59.00 44.042.30
11/20/2010 ABF REVIEWED NOTICE OF CHANGE OF 0.2 495.00 99.00 44,141.30
ASSIGNMENT FOR COMPLEX CIVIL
LITIGATION
1172472010 ABF REVIEWED NOTICE OF ENTRY OF 0.3 495.00 148.50 44,289 80
ORDER GRANTING PETITION FOR
COORDINATION
11/24/2010 ABF MEETING WITH CLIENT RE: STATUS 0.5 495.00 247.50 44,537.30
01/20/2011 BSS MEETING RE: CASE STATUS 0.2 295.00 59.00 44,596.30
01/20/2011 ABF REVIEWED NOTICE OF 0.2 495.00 99.00 44,695.30
REASSIGNMENT OF CASE
01/20/2011 OR REVIEWED NOTICE OF 0.2 395.00 79.00 44.774.30
REASSIGNMENT OF CASE
0172172011 BSS REVIEWED ORDER AND STATUS OF 0.2 295.00 59.00 44,833.30
CASE
02/07/2011 ABF REVIEWED NOTICE OF ENTRY OF 0.2 495.00 99.00 44.932.30
ORDER ASSIGNING TRIAL JUDGE
02/07/2011 OR REVIEWED NOTICE OF ENTRY OF 0.2 395.00 79.00 45,011.30
ORDER ASSIGNING TRIAL JUDGE
42/10/2011 BSS REVIEWED COURT 0.2 295.00 59.00 45.070.30
CORRESPONDANCE
02/14/2011 ABF REVIEWED DEFENDANT'S STATUS 0.5 495.00 247.50 45,317.80
REPORT
AMOUNT DUE
$61.,236.80
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Felahy Law Group, APC STATE E N?

4000 Cover Strect

Suite 100 DATE

Long Beach, CA 90808

. 412472012
Tel. (562) 499-2121
TO:
SAM BALOOCH
AMOUNT DUE
$61,236.80
DATE TRANSACTION QTYy RATE AMOUNT BALANCE

02/14/2011 OR REVIEWED DEFENDANT'S STATUS 0.5 395.00 197.50 45,515.30
REPORT

02/15/2011 BSS REVIEWED OPPOSING COUNSEL'S 0.2 295.00 59.00 45,574.30
PROPOSED STIPULATION

02/15/2011 ABF REVIEWED STIPULATION TO 0.2 495,00 99.00 43.673.30
EXTEND TIME FOR DEFENDANT TO
RESPOND

0272212011 ABF REVIEWED NOTICE OF ENTRY OF 0.2 495.00 99,00 45,772.30
JOINT STIPULATION

03/11/2011 OR REVIEWED EMAIL TO/FROM W, 0.2 395.00 79.00 45.851.30
AUDET AND T. FERLAUTO RE:
STIPULATION FOR MEDIATION

03/1172011 OR REVIEWED PROPOSED CLASS 2 395.00 790.00 46,641.30
REQUEST FOR PRODUCTION OF
DOCUMENTS

G3/11/2011 OR REVIEWED EDITS FROM AUDET TO 0.5 395.00 197.50 46,838,80
REQUESTS FOR PRODUCTION OF
DOCUMENTS

03/11/2011 ABF REVIEWED PROPOSED CLASS 2 495.00 990.00 47.828.80
REQUEST FOR PRODUCTION OF
DOCUMENTS

03/1172011 ABF CONFERENCE RE: EDITS TO 0.5 495.00 247.50 48,076.30
DISCOVERY

AMOUNT DUE
$61,236.80
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Felahy Law Group, APC S?ATE E T

4000 Cover Street
Suite 100 DATE

Long Beach, CA 90808

4/2472012
Tel. (562)499-2121
[ TC:
SAM BALOOCH
AMOUNT DUE
$61,236.80
DATE TRANSACTION QTyY RATE AMOQUNT BALANCE

03/1172011 OR CONFERENCE RE: EDITS TO 0.5 395.00 197.50 48,273.80
DISCOVERY

03/1172011 ABF REVIEWED EMAILS RE: MEDIATION 0.5 495 .00 247.50 48,521.30

03/1172011 ABF CONFERENCE RE: MEDIATION FOR 0.5 495.00 247 50 48.768.80
STATE CASES

03/1172011 OR CONFERENCE RE: MEDIATION FOR 0.5 395.00 197.50 48,966.30
STATE CASES

03/17/2011 | OR REVIEWED AUDET EMAIL RE: 02 395.00 79.00 49,045.30
STIPULATION

03/17/2011 OR REVIEWED STIPULATION FOR CASE 0.5 395.00 197.50 49,242 80
MANAGEMENT ORDER

03/25/2011 ABF REVIEWED STIPULATION AND CASE 0.5 495 00 247,50 49.490,30
MANAGEMENT ORDER

03/28/2011 ABF REVIEWED NOTICES OF ENTRY OF 0.3 493.00 148.50 49,638.80
STIPULATION

06/2G/2011 ABF PREPARED MEMO RE: APPLE 0.5 495.00 247.50 49,886.30
ARBITRATION CLLAUSES

06/20/2011 ABF CONFERENCE RE: RESEARCH ON 0.5 495.00 247.50 50,133.80
ARBITRATION

06/20/2011 OR CONFERENCE RE: RESEARCH ON 0.5 395.00 197.50 50,331.30
ARBITRATION

06/21/2011 BSS RESEARCH CONCERNING 1.5 295.00 442 50 50,773.80
ARBITRATION OF CLASS CLAIMS

AMOUNT DUE
$61,236.80
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Felahy Law Group, APC
4000 Cover Street

Suite 100

Long Beach, CA 90808
Tel. (562) 499-2121

| 1o

SAM BALOOCH

STATEMENT

DATE

4/24/2012

AMOUNT DUE

$61,236.80

DATE TRANSACTION QTy RATE AMOUNT BALANCE

06/21/2011 OR RESEARCH APPLE'S ARBITRATION 35 395.00 1,382.50 52.156.30
POLICY FOR CLASS ACTION CLAIMS

06/21/201} OR E-MAIL TO CLIENT RE: RECEIPTS FOR 0.2 395.00 79.00 52,235.30
PURCHASE

06/21/2011 OR REVIEWED EMAIL RESPONSE FROM 0.2 395.00 79.00 52.314.30
CLIENT RE: RECEIPTS

06/22/2011 OR REVIEW AWARDED US PATENT 3.5 395.00 1.382.50 53,696.80
7.966,578 RE APPLE iPHONE ON 06.21.11

06/22/2011] OR DRAFTED MEMO RE US PATENT 2.5 395.00 987.50 54,684.30
7,966,578 RE APPLE iPHONE

0672272011 OR CONFERENCE RE US PATENT 7,966,578 0.5 395.00 197.50 54.881.80
RE APPLE iPHONE AWARDED 06.21.11

06/22/2011 ABF CONFERENCE RE US PATENT 0.5 495.00 247.50 55.129.30
7,966,578 RE APPLE iPHONE AWARDED
06.21.11

06/23/2011 BSS CONFERENCE W/ OR RE: 0.5 295.00 147.50 55,276.80
ARBITRATION

06/23/2011 OR RESEARCH RE: IMPLICATIONS OF 3.5 395.00 1.382.50 56,659.30
SETTLEMENT OF CLASS ACTION

06/23/2011 OR CONFERENCE W/ BSS RE: 0.5 395.00 197.50 56.856.80
ARBITRATION

07/01/2011 BSS T/C FROM COURT 0.2 295.00 59.00 56,915.80

0771972011 ABF REVIEWED REPORTS OF APPLE 0.5 495.00 247.50 57,163.30
SALES OF PRODUCT

AMOUNT DUE
$61,236.80
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Felahy Law Group, APC %T @T E E T

4000 Cover Street

Suite 100 DATE

Long Beach, CA 90808

4/2472012
Tel. (562)499-2121
l TO:
SAM BALOOCH
AMOUNT DUE
$61,236.80
DATE TRANSACTION QTY RATE AMOUNT BALANCE

08/23/2011 ABF REVIEWED ELECTRONIC SERVICE 0.2 495.00 99.00 57,262.30
RE: NTC OF WITHDRAWAL

08/23/2011 ABF REVIEWED E-FILED MOSER NOTICE ’ 0.2 495.00 99.00 57.361.30
OF WITHDRAWAL

09012011 ABF REVIEWED CASE STATUS 0.5 495.00 247,50 57.608.80

09/01/2011 ABF MEETING WITH CLIENT 0.5 495.00 247.50 57,856.30

111572011 BSS CONFERENCE RE: STATUS OF STATE 0.5 295.00 147.50 58,003.80
CASE

0172472012 OR REVIEWED EMAIL RE: SETTLEMENT 3 395.00 118.50 58,122.30

01/312012 OR REVIEWED TERMS OF SETTLEMENT 1.5 395.00 592.50 58,714.80
FOR STATE CASES

01/31/2012 ABF REVIEWED TERMS OF SETTLEMENT 1.5 495.00 742.50 59,457.30
FOR STATE CASES

017312012 ABF CONFERENCE RE: IMPACT OF 0.5 495.00 247.50 59,704.80
SETTLEMENT ON STATE CASE

01/31/2012 OR CONFERENCE RE: IMPACT OF 0.5 395.00 197,50 59,902.30
SETTLEMENT ON STATE CASE

02/01/2012 ABF MEETING WITH CLIENT RE: 1 495,00 495.00 60,397.30
SETTLEMENT OF CLASS CLAIMS

03/30/2012 COPIES/SCANS FROM 062310-033012 2,170 0.25 542.50 60,939.80

(04/04/2012 ABF REVIEWED EMAIL FROM DAVIDSON 0.3 495.00 148.30 61,088.30
RE: SETTLEMENT

04/10/2012 ABF REVIEWED CORRESPONDENCE 0.3 495.00 148.50 61,236.80
FROM AUDET RE: SETTLEMENT

AMOUNT DUE
$61.236.80
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