EXHIBIT B

COOK & IRBY, LLP IN SUPPORT OF AN AWARD OF ATTORNEYS' FEES AND EXPENSES

11

12

13 14

16 17

15

18

19 20

21

2223

24

26

25

27

I, R. Brent Irby, declare as follows:

- 1. I am a member of the firm of McCallum, Hoaglund, Cook & Irby, LLP. I am submitting this declaration in support of my firm's application for an award of attorneys' fees and expenses in connection with services rendered in the above-entitled action.
- 2. The firm is counsel of record for plaintiff David C. Perdue. Our firm was not appointed lead counsel in this consolidated MDL. I have not ever been paid or reimbursed any fees or expenses in this case as of the filing of this document.
- 3. The identification and background of my firm and its partners is attached hereto as Exhibit A.
- Attached to this Declaration as Exhibit B is a detailed breakdown and billing of 4. the attorney time and expenses my firm has expended and incurred in this litigation. As evidenced by Exhibit C attached hereto, I had previously provided this same breakdown and billing record to Lead Counsel in this case on April 27, 2012. I provided this breakdown of attorney time and expenses incurred by my firm to Lead Counsel with the expectation that the information would be provided to the settlement Court in the request for fees and reimbursement of expenses. Lead Counsel subsequently provided me and other non-lead attorneys with a suggested declaration to submit that was in the same form as the declarations submitted by Lead Counsel in their application for fees. I utilized and submitted the form declaration suggested by Lead Counsel with the understanding that either it was sufficient for submission or that my previously-provided detailed attorney time and expense records would be submitted along with my declaration. My detailed breakdown and billing of attorney time and expenses incurred by my firm was not provided by Lead Counsel to the Court along with my declaration. In any event, I am attaching to this Declaration as Exhibit B a breakdown and billing of the attorney time and expenses incurred by my firm in this litigation.
- 5. The information contained on Exhibit B regarding my firm's time and expenses is taken from time and expense printouts prepared and maintained by my firm in the ordinary course of business. I am the attorney who oversaw and/or conducted the day-to-day activities in

the litigation and who reviewed these printouts (and backup documentation where necessary or appropriate). The purpose of these reviews was to confirm both the accuracy of the entries on the printouts as well as the necessity for and reasonableness of the time and expenses committed to the litigation. As a result of these reviews, reductions were made to both time and expenses either in the exercise of billing judgment or to conform to the firm's guidelines and policies regarding certain expenses such as charges for hotels, meals, and transportation. As a result of these reviews and adjustments, I believe that the time reflected in the firm's lodestar calculation and the expenses for which payment is sought are reasonable in amount and were necessary for the effective and efficient prosecution and resolution of the litigation.

6. The total number of hours spent on this litigation by my firm is 21.6. (*See* Ex. B.) The total lodestar amount for attorney/paraprofessional time based on the firm's current rates is \$9,720.00. The hourly rates shown below are the usual and customary rates charged for each individual. A breakdown of the lodestar is as follows:

SUPPLEMENTAL DECLARATION OF R. BRENT IRBY FILED ON BEHALF OF MCCALLUM, HOAGLUND, COOK & IRBY, LLP IN SUPPORT OF AN AWARD OF ATTORNEYS' FEES AND EXPENSES

1
2
3
4
5

(D) D

7 |

9

6

10

11

12

13

1415

16 17

1819

20

22

23

21

24

26

25

2728

<i>NAME</i>		HOURS	RATE	LODESTAR
R. Brent Irby	(P)	21.6	450.00	\$9,720.00
	(P)			
	(A)			
	(A)			
	(A)			
TOTAL				\$9,720.00

(P) Partner

(A) Associate

7. My firm seeks an award of \$578.62 in expenses which were reasonably and necessarily committed to the prosecution of the litigation. (*See* Ex. B.) They are broken down as follows:

EXPENSES

From Inception to May 21, 2012

EXPENSE CATEGORY	TOTAL
Out-of-Town Meals, Hotels & Transportation	\$ 0.00
Photocopies (in-house: 677 copies @ \$0.25 per page)	\$169.25
Postage & Delivery	\$ 20.08
Telephone, Facsimile	\$ 0.00
Filing, Witness & Other Fees	\$350.00
Lexis, Westlaw, Online Library Research	\$ 0.00
Interest	\$ 39.29
TOTAL	\$578.62

- 8. The expenses pertaining to this case are reflected in the books and records of this firm. These books and records are prepared from expense vouchers, check records and other documents and are an accurate record of the expenses.
- 9. I submit that the time and expense submission included in this Declaration were incurred in this litigation. I request that the Court award my firm \$9,720.00 in attorneys' fees and \$578.62 in expenses reimbursement for a total of \$10,298.62.

I declare under penalty of perjury under the laws of the State of California that the foregoing is true and correct.

SUPPLEMENTAL DECLARATION OF R. BRENT IRBY FILED ON BEHALF OF MCCALLUM, HOAGLUND, COOK & IRBY, LLP IN SUPPORT OF AN AWARD OF ATTORNEYS' FEES AND EXPENSES

ĺ	Case5:10-md-02188-RMW Document81-2 Filed09/24/12 Page6 of 27
1	
2	Executed this 21 st day of September, 2012, at Vestavia Hills, Alabama.
3	2
4	R. Burtoll
5	R. Brent Irby
6	
7	
8	
9	
10	
11	
12	
13	
14	
15	
16 17	
18	
19	
20	
21	
22	
23	
24	

SUPPLEMENTAL DECLARATION OF R. BRENT IRBY FILED ON BEHALF OF MCCALLUM, HOAGLUND, COOK & IRBY, LLP IN SUPPORT OF AN AWARD OF ATTORNEYS' FEES AND EXPENSES

Exhibit A

McCallum, Hoaglund, Cook & Irby, L.L.P. 905 Montgomery Highway, Suite 201, Vestavia Hills, Alabama 35216 Telephone: (205)824-7767 Facsimile: (205)824-7768 www.mhcilaw.com

Charles A. "Chip" McCallum, III founded McCallum Law Firm, LLC in February 2001. From 1996 to 2001, he was a partner with Campbell, Waller & McCallum, LLC, now Campbell, Waller & Poer, LLC. Prior to that time, Chip was a shareholder in the downtown law firm of Haskell, Slaughter & Young, LLC. Eric Hoaglund, Martha Cook and Brent Irby practiced with Chip at the firm of Campbell, Waller & McCallum, LLC. They became associated with McCallum Law Firm in June 2001, and became shareholders in McCallum, Hoaglund, Cook & Irby, LLP ("MHCI") in January 2005.

MHCI specializes in general business and consumer litigation, products liability law (defense), real estate transactions, class action litigation and general civil litigation (plaintiff and defense).

CHARLES A. "CHIP" McCALLUM, III was born in Birmingham, Alabama. He attended the University of Alabama in Tuscaloosa, Alabama where he received a Bachelor's of Arts degree in 1983. In 1986 he received his Juris Doctorate from Cumberland School of Law in Birmingham, Alabama where he was a member of the American Journal of Trial Advocacy (1984-1986). From 1986 to 1996 Chip practiced with the law firm of Haskell, Slaughter & Young in Birmingham. In 1996, he joined the firm of Campbell, Waller & McCallum, LLC and, in 2001, began the firm of McCallum Law Firm, LLC in Vestavia Hills, Alabama. Chip is a member of the Birmingham and American Bar Associations, the Alabama State Bar and the Alabama Trial Lawyer's Association. His practice is devoted to complex business and commercial litigation, including business torts, unfair and deceptive trade practices, contract litigation, insurance bad faith, securities litigation and shareholder disputes. Chip's email address is cmc.allum@mhcilaw.com.

ERIC D. HOAGLUND is a native of McComb, Mississippi and a 1992 (summa cum laude) graduate of Jacksonville State University where he received a Bachelor's of Arts degree. In 1995, Eric received his Juris Doctorate from Cumberland School of Law at Samford University in Birmingham, Alabama. Eric was admitted to the Alabama State Bar in 1995. He is also a member of the U.S. Court of Appeals for the Eleventh Circuit, the U.S. District Courts for the Northern, Middle and Southern Districts of Alabama, the Birmingham Bar Association, the Alabama State Bar and the Alabama Defense Lawyers Association. Prior to joining McCallum Law Firm, LLC, Eric practiced with Portfield, Harper & Mills and, later, Campbell, Waller & McCallum, LLC. Eric specializes in the areas of products liability law, construction defect litigation, premises liability law, automobile liability, general civil defense law, real estate transactions, and bad faith litigation. His email address is choglund@mhcilaw.com

MARTHA REEVES COOK was born in Houston, Texas and raised in Selma, Alabama. Martha received a Bachelor of Arts degree in 1990 from Randolph-Macon Woman's College in Lynchburg, Virginia. In 1996 she received her Juris Doctorate from Cumberland School of Law in Birmingham, Alabama where she was a member of the Henry Upson Sims Moot Court Board (Chief Justice, 1995 to 1996). Martha was admitted to the Alabama State Bar in 1996. She also is admitted to practice in the U.S. Court of Appeals for the Eleventh Circuit and the U.S. District Courts for the Northern and Middle Districts of Alabama. Martha is a member of the Birmingham Bar Association, the Birmingham Inns of Court and the American Bar Association. She is an Ambassador with the Vestavia Hills Chamber of Commerce for which she served as Chairperson of the 2004 Mayor's Prayer Breakfast. Prior to joining McCallum Law Firm, LLC, she practiced with Campbell, Waller & McCallum, LLC. Martha practices in the areas of disability insurance law, real estate transactions, personal injury law and general civil defense law. Her email address is mcook@mhcilaw.com.

R. BRENT IRBY is a native of Eufaula, Alabama. Brent received his Bachelor's of Science degree (cum laude) from the University of Alabama in Tuscaloosa in 1995 and his Juris Doctorate (cum laude) from the University in 1998 where he was a member of the Farrah Law Society, Phi Delta Phi and the Journal of Legal Profession (1997 - 1998). Brent was admitted to the Alabama State Bar in 1998 and the Tennessee State Bar in 1999. He is admitted to practice in the U.S. Court of Appeals for the Eleventh Circuit and the U.S. District Courts for the Northern, Middle and Southern Districts of Alabama. Brent is also a member of the Birmingham Bar Association, the Young Lawyers Section of the Birmingham Bar Association, the Alabama Trial Lawyers Association (Board of Governors), the Association of Trial Lawyers of America, and the American Bar Association. Prior to joining McCallum Law Firm, LLC, Brent practiced with Campbell, Waller & McCallum, LLC. Brent specializes in the practice areas of consumer fraud litigation, insurance fraud litigation, mass torts, employment law and class action litigation. His email address is birby@mhcilaw.com.

Exhibit B

McCallum, Hoaglund, Cook & Irby, L.L.P.

905 Montgomery Highway Suite 201 Vestavia Hills, Alabama 35216

EIN #20-2162092

Ph:205-824-7767

Fax:205-824-7768

David C. Purdue v. Apple, Inc. and AT&T

April 27, 2012

File #:

3854

Inv #:

5573

Attention:

RE:

Purdue, David C. v. Apple, Inc. and AT&T Corp.

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	LAWYER
Jul-06-10	Telephone call with client; preliminary research.	2.50	1,125.00	RBI
Jul-09-10	Receipt and review of initial documents from client; additional research.	5.20	2,340.00	RBI
Jul-13-10	Draft and revise Complaint; conference with client.	7.20	3,240.00	RBI
Jul-15-10	Letter to clerk with Summons, Complaint, Coverhsset and Filing Fee.	0.20	90.00	RBI
Jul-19-10	Receipt and review of Filed Summons and Complaint, Notice Regarding Corporate Disclosure Statement by Plaintiff Purdue; receipt and review of notice setting initial case management conference for September 13, 2010 at 10:00 a.m.; receipt and review of notice to Brent Irby to associate local counsel; receipt and review of docket text stating Brent Irby's bar status has been verified and active.	0.10	45.00	RBI
Jul-20-10	Receipt and review of Order by Judge Campbell recusing himself from the case.	0.10	45.00	RBI
Jul-21-10	Receipt and review of Notice of Appearance by Trevor Howell.	0.10	45.00	RBI
Jul-22-10	Receipt and review of Order	0.10	45.00	RBI

Invoice #:	Case5:10-md-02188-RMW Document81-2 Filed0	09/24/12	Page11 of 27 April 27,	2012
	reassigning case to Judge Trauger and setting a case management conference.			
Jul-27-10	Draft and finalize Amended Complaint.	1.10	495.00	RBI
Jul-30-10	Receipt and review of Notice of Filing Amended Motion and Publication of Revised Briefing Schedule; receipt and review of Corporate Disclosure Statement of AT&T Mobility, LLC in MDL; receipt and review of Notice of Related Actions by AT&T Mobility, LLC in MDL; Notice of Appearance in MDL by AT&T Mobility, LLC; receipt and review of Memorandum of Plaintiff Tietze in Support of Motion to Dismiss Actions to Northern District of California; receipt and review of Order regarding Motion fo Plaintiff Tietze for Transfer of Actions to the Northern District of California for Consolidated Pretrial Proceedings.	0.20	90.00	RBI
	Receipt and review of Filed Amended Complaint.	0.10	45.00	RBI
	Receipt and review of Proof of Service - Summons to Apple, Inc. and AT&T Corp.	0.10	45.00	RBI
Aug-02-10	Receipt and review of letter from clerk with Service Summons.	0.10	45.00	RBI
Aug-04-10	Receipt and review of acknowledgment of service by Apple, Inc. and AT&T Mobility, LLC.	0.10	45.00	RBI
Aug-06-10	Receipt and review of Memorandum of Plaintiff Goodglick in Response to Motions for Transfer and Coordination or Consolidation Under 28 U.S.C. 1407.	0.10	45.00	RBI
Aug-10-10	Receipt and review of Sooy letter to clerk with amended panel service list; receipt and review of Notice of Related Action by AT&T Mobility, LLC	0.10	45.00	RBI
Aug-11-10	Receipt and review of Memorandum of Plaintiff Tietze in Response to Motions for Transfer of Actions.	0.10	45.00	RBI
Aug-12-10	Receipt and review of Amendments - Electronic Filing Copies; receipt and review of	0.20	90.00	RBI

Case5:10-md-02188-RMW	Document81-2	Eilod00/2//12	Dana12 of 27
Cases. To-Illa-02100-Kivivi	Documentor-2	FIIEUU9/24/12	Payerz or Zi

	Case5:10-md-02188-RM\	W Document81-2	Filed09/24/12	•	
Invoice #:	5573	Page 3		Aprıl	27, 2012
	notice to counsel regard receipt and review of possible. The country of the count	anel service list for ew of Corporate f Defendant apple, Inclotice of Appearnace be; receipt and review or Waiver of Oral review of Notice of	y of		
Aug-13-10	Receipt and review of case management configuration 2010 at 1:15 pm.; receip Defendant Apple, Inc.'s Proceedings or Alternate Enlargement of Time to Complaint.	erence for October 7, pt and review of s Motion to Stay tive Motion for	0.10	45.00	RBI
Aug-16-10	Receipt and review of Party Todd Mayo to M Consolidate Pursuant t	otion to Transfer and	0.10	45.00	RBI
	Receipt and review of to Stay Proceedings; re docket notice stating b Hartfield has been veri	eceipt and review of ar status of C. Meade	n 0.10	45.00	RBI
Aug-18-10	Receipt and review of Mobility LLC to Motio to 28 U.S.C. 1407.	Response of AT&T ons to Transfer Pursua	0.10 ant	45.00	RBI
Aug-20-10	Receipt and review of and 7.5(e) Notice of A 4 Marketing Sales Pra Liability Litigation.	ctions Related to iPho	0.10 one	45.00	RBI
	Receipt and review of Clerk with Notice of T	Preovolos letter to Magage Along Cases.	DL 0.10	45.00	RBI
Aug-30-10	Receipt and review of with Notice of Present Mayo.	letter from Lapinski tation for Plaintiff Tod	0.10	45.00	RBI
	Receipt and review of by Stephen W. Grace.		0.10	45.00	RBI
Sep-01-10	Receipt and review of stating bar status of Stand active.	docket text from cleritephen Grace is verifie	k 0.10 ed	45.00	RBI

Case5:10-md-02188-RMW Document81-2 Filed09/24/12 Page13 of 27	2012
Invoice #: 5573 Page 4 April 27,	2012
Sep-13-10 Receipt and review of Noticve of Presentation 0.10 45.00 or Waiver of Oral Argument by Daniel Ward.	RBI
Draft and file Notice of Presentation or Waiver 0.20 90.00 of Oral Argument by Brent Irby.	RBİ
Sep-16-10 Receipt and review of Motion to Withdraw 0.10 45.00 Apperanance by Trevor Howell.	RBI
Scp-20-10 Receipt and review of Order granting Motion to Withdraw Appearance by Trevor Howell. 45.00	RBI
Oct-11-10 Receipt and review of transfer order. 0.10 45.00	RBI
Receipt and review of Transfer Order; receipt 0.10 45.00 and review of order stating case remains stayed and a case management conference that is scheduled for October 7, 2010 has been continued.	RBI
Nov-15-10 Receipt and review of certified copy of transfer 0.10 45.00 order.	RBI
Nov-17-10 Receipt and review of Clerk's notice advising 0.10 45.00 counsel of acknowledgment and receipt of case.	RBI
Receipt and review of pleading stating case 0.10 45.00 has been transferred.	RBI
Dec-02-10 Receipt and review of Joint Stipulation 0.00 0.00 Extending Time to Respond to Complaint.	RBI
Dec-15-10 Receipt and review of pleading regarding case 0.10 45.00 being reassigned to Magistrate Judge Paul Grewal for discovery purposes.	RBI
Jan-19-11 Receipt and review of Stipulation and Pretrial 0.10 45.00 Order No. 1.	RBI
Receipt and review of Motion to Withdraw as 0.10 45.00 Attorney by C. Meade Hartfield.	RBI
Jan-21-11 Receipt and review of Order granting 0.10 45.00 Defendant's Motion to Withdraw as Attorney.	RBI
Feb-22-11 Receipt and review of Change of Address for 0.10 45.00 Meade Hartfield.	RBI
Feb-20-12 Receipt and review of Order granting 0.20 90.00 Conditional Certification of	RBI

Invoice #:	Case5:10-md-02188-RMW Documer	nt81-2	Filed09/24/12	•	of 27 oril 27, 2012
myorce #.	3373				
	Settlement Class and Preliminary App Settlement Agreement and Release.	roval of			
Feb-22-12	Conference with client regarding settle	ement.	1.20	540.00	RBI
Apr-19-12	Receipt and review of letter from Trev Howell with invoice for services.	or/or	0.10	45.00	RBI
	Totals		21.60	\$9,720.00	
DISBURS	EMENTS			98	
	Filing Fee			350.00	£.;
Jul-31-10	Photocopy Expense			3.75	
Jul-51-10	Postage Expense			20.08	
Aug-31-10	-			127.50	
Sep-01-10	Interest			1.97	
Sep-30-10	Photocopy Expense			10.75	
2 JF 7 7 7 7	Interest			2.14	
Oct-31-10	Photocopy Expense			1.50	
Nov-11-10				2.08	
Nov-19-10) Interest			2.11	
Nov-30-10	Photocopy Expense			1.00	
Dec-22-10	Interest			2.34	
Dec-31-10	Photocopy Expense			3.75	
Jan-27-11	Interest			2.43	
Feb-15-11	Interest			2.01	
Feb-28-11	Photocopy Expense			5.75	
Mar-04-11	Interest			1.89	
Apr-06-11	Interest			1.89 1.98	
May-03-1	1 Interest			2.18	
Jun-21-11	Interest			1.23	
Jul-13-11	Interest			2.30	
Aug-10-1	1 Interest			2.30	
Sep-28-11	Interest			2.16	
Oct-24-11	Interest			2.10	
Dec-22-11	Interest			2.14	
Jan-13-12				2.38 1.71	
Feb-17-12	2 Interest			15.25	
Feb-29-12	Photocopy Expense			2.14	
Mar-14-12	2 Interest			4.14	
	Totals		:	\$578.62	

Total Fee & Disbursements

\$10,298.62

Case5:10-md-02188-RMW Document81-2 Filed09/24/12 Page15 of 27

Invoice #: 5573 Page 6 April 27, 2012

Balance Now Duc \$10,298.62

TAX ID Number 20-2162092

TREVOR W. HOWELL ATTORNEY AT LAW

The Pinnacle at Symphony Place 150 Third Avenue South, 17th Floor Nashville, Tennessee 37201 Telephone (615) 244-4994 Facsimile (615) 256-6339 thowell@gsrm.com

VIA E-MAIL

McCallum, Hoaglund, Cook & Irby, LLP 905 Montgomery Highway, Suite 201 Vestavia Hills, AL 35216 April 19, 2012 Page: 1 Invoice No. 11953

Re: David C. Purdue v. Apple, Inc.

U.S. District Court, Middle District of Tennessee

Civil Action No. 3:10-0687

For professional services rendered between July 15, 2010, and September 17, 2010:

Telephone conferences and e-mail transmissions by and between Brent Irby, Esq., and TWH; draft and file Notice of Appearance as local counsel; monitor pleadings and correspondence and file Notice of Withdrawal as local counsel.

2.05 hour @ \$300/hour:	
Total Due This Statement:	\$ 615.00

PLEASE RETURN THIS STATEMENT COVER WITH YOUR PAYMENT
MADE PAYABLE TO TREVOR W. HOWELL, ATTORNEY AT LAW,
TO ENSURE PROPER CREDIT TO YOUR ACCOUNT
THANK YOU.

Exhibit C

Lori Marler

From: Stuart Davidson [sdavidson@rgrdlaw.com]

Sent: Friday, April 27, 2012 12:54 PM

To: Brent Irby Cc: Lori Marler

Subject: RE: In re Apple iPhone 4 Products Liability Litigation

TimeMattersID: M5DCEA05B9726945

TM Matter No: 3854

TM Matter Reference: Purdue, David C. v. Apple, Inc. and AT&T Corp.

Received and hope you are well

Stu

----Original Message----

From: Brent Irby [mailto:birby@mhcilaw.com]

Sent: Friday, April 27, 2012 1:52 PM

To: Stuart Davidson Cc: Lori Marler

Subject: In re Apple iPhone 4 Products Liability Litigation

Please see attached letter with time and expenses.

Thanks. Brent Irby

R. Brent Irby McCallum, Hoaglund, Cook & Irby, LLP 905 Montgomery Highway Suite 201 Vestavia Hills, Alabama 35216

Phone: (205)824-7767 Fax: (205)824-7768 www.mhcilaw.com

ATTENTION: ATTORNEY CLIENT COMMUNICATION AND/OR ATTORNEY WORK PRODUCT INFORMATION MAY BE ENCLOSED

This message originates from the law firm of McCallum Hoaglund Cook & Irby, LLP. Its text and attachments may contain legally privileged and confidential information intended solely for the use of the addressee. If you are not the intended recipient, you should immediately stop reading this message and delete it from your system. Any unauthorized reading, distribution, copying or other use of this message or its attachments is strictly prohibited. All

personal messages express solely the views of the sender and not those of McCallum Hoaglund Cook & Irby, LLP. This message may not be copied or distributed without this disclaimer. If you received this message in error, please reply to the sender immediately and permanently delete this message. Thank you.

NOTICE: This email message is for the sole use of the intended

recipient(s) and may contain information that is confidential and protected from disclosure by the attorney-client privilege, as attorney work product, or by other applicable privileges. Any unauthorized review, use, disclosure or distribution is prohibited.

Case5:10-md-02188-RMW Document81-2 Filed09/24/12 Page19 of 27

If you are not the intended recipient, please contact the sender by reply email and destroy all copies of the original message.



CHARLES A. McCALLUM, III

ERIC D. HOAGLUND*

MARTHA REEVES COOK

R. BRENT IRBY**

*ALSO ADMITTED IN TEXAS

**ALSO ADMITTED IN TENNESSEE

**ALSO ADMITTED IN GEORGIA

Writer's e-mail: birby@mhcilaw.com

April 27, 2012

VIA ELECTRONIC MAIL - sdavidson@rgrdlaw.com

Stuart Davidson Robbins Geller Rudman & Dowd, LLP 120 East Palmetto Park Road suite 500 Boca Raton, Florida 33432

RE: In re Apple iPhone 4 Products Liability Litigation

No.: 5:10-md-02188-RMW (N.D. Cal.)

Dear Stuart:

We have reviewed the settlement documents in the above-referenced matter with our client, David Perdue. Our client approves and agrees with the terms of the settlement. You are hereby authorized to execute the settlement on behalf of the undersigned and our client.

Additionally, I am including the expense report and time sheets for my firm and that of my cocounsel, Trevor Howell. If you would, please let me know in advance if these reports will be submitted with the Settlement Court.

Please feel free to call if you have any questions or concerns.

Sincerely,

R. Brent Irby

Englishing

McCallum, Hoaglund, Cook & Irby, L.L.P.

905 Montgomery Highway Suite 201 Vestavia Hills, Alabama 35216

EIN #20-2162092

Ph:205-824-7767

Fax:205-824-7768

David C. Purdue v. Apple, Inc. and AT&T

April 27, 2012

File #:	3854
Inv #:	5573

Attention:

RE:

Purdue, David C. v. Apple, Inc. and AT&T Corp.

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	LAWYER
Jul-06-10	Telephone call with client; preliminary research.	2.50	1,125.00	RBI
Jul-09-10	Receipt and review of initial documents from client; additional research.	5.20	2,340.00	RBI
Jul-13-10	Draft and revise Complaint; conference with client.	7.20	3,240.00	RBI
Jul-15-10	Letter to clerk with Summons, Complaint, Coverhsset and Filing Fee.	0.20	90.00	RBI
Jul-19-10	Receipt and review of Filed Summons and Complaint, Notice Regarding Corporate Disclosure Statement by Plaintiff Purdue; receipt and review of notice setting initial case management conference for September 13, 2010 at 10:00 a.m.; receipt and review of notice to Brent Irby to associate local counsel; receipt and review of docket text stating Brent Irby's bar status has been verified and active.	0.10	45.00	RBI
Jul-20-10	Receipt and review of Order by Judge Campbell recusing himself from the case.	0.10	45.00	RBI
Jul-21-10	Receipt and review of Notice of Appearance by Trevor Howell.	0.10	45.00	RBI
Jul-22-10	Receipt and review of Order	0.10	45.00	RBI

(Case5:10-md-02188-RMV	V Document81-2	Filed09/24/12	•		
Invoice #:	5573	Page 2		Apri	27, 2012	
reassigning case to Judge Trauger and setting a case management conference.						
Jul-27-10	Draft and finalize Amer	nded Complaint.	1.10	495.00	RBI	
Jul-30-10	Receipt and review of N Amended Motion and P Briefing Schedule; rece Corporate Disclosure St Mobility, LLC in MDL Notice of Related Action LLC in MDL; Notice of by AT&T Mobility, LL of Memorandum of Pla of Motion to Dismiss A District of California; re Order regarding Motion Transfer of Actions to t California for Consolid Proceedings.	Publication of Revised ipt and review of tatement of AT&T receipt and review of this by AT&T Mobility of Appearance in MDL c; receipt and review intiff Tietze in Support to Northern receipt and review of the Northern District of the Northern District of	f /, rt	90.00	RBI	
	Receipt and review of I Complaint.	Filed Amended	0.10	45.00	RBI	
	Receipt and review of I Summons to Apple, Inc		0.10	45.00	RBI	
Aug-02-10	Receipt and review of letter from clerk with Service Summons.		0.10	45.00	RBI	
Aug-04-10	Receipt and review of acknowledgment of service by Apple, Inc. and AT&T Mobility, LLC.		0.10	45.00	RBI	
Aug-06-10	O Receipt and review of Memorandum of Plaintiff Goodglick in Response to Motions for Transfer and Coordination or Consolidation Under 28 U.S.C. 1407.		0.10 for	45.00	RBI	
Aug-10-10	Receipt and review of Sooy letter to clerk we amended panel service list; receipt and revie of Notice of Related Action by AT&T Mobility, LLC		th 0.10 w	45.00	RBI	
Aug-11-10	Receipt and review of Plaintiff Tietze in Resp Transfer of Actions.	Receipt and review of Memorandum of Plaintiff Tietze in Response to Motions for Transfer of Actions.		45.00	RBI	
Aug-12-10	Receipt and review of Electronic Filing Copi	Amendments - es; receipt and review	0.20 of	90.00	RBI	

Case5:10-md-02188-RMW Document81-2 Filed09/24/12 Page23 of 27

	Cases.10-mu-02			1 11CUO3/24/12	•	
Invoice #:	5573	Page	3		Aprii	27, 2012
	receipt and re MDL; receipt Disclosure St receipt and re Apple, Inc. in Notice of Pre Argument; re	asel regarding enview of panel ser and review of Catement of Defer view of Notice of MDL case; rece sentation or Wai ceipt and review on set for Septer	rvice list for orporate and ant apple, Inc. of Appearnace by sipt and review over of Oral of Notice of	r f		
Aug-13-10	case manager 2010 at 1:15 p Defendant Ap Proceedings of	eview of Order r nent conference pm.; receipt and ople, Inc.'s Motic or Alternative Mo of Time to Resp	for October 7, review of on to Stay otion for	0.10	45.00	RBI
Aug-16-10	Party Todd M	eview of Respor Iayo to Motion to Pursuant to 28 U	o Transfer and	0.10	45.00	RBI
	to Stay Proce docket notice	eview of Order gedings; receipt a stating bar statubeen verified.	nd review of	0.10	45.00	RBI
Aug-18-10	_	review of Respond to Motions to 1 1407.		0.10	45.00	RBI
Aug-20-10	and 7.5(e) No	review of Apple otice of Actions Sales Practices a gation.	Related to iPhon	0.10 ne	45.00	RBI
		review of Preovo		ol 0.10	45.00	RBI
Aug-30-10	Receipt and with Notice of Mayo.	review of letter for Presentation f	rom Lapinski or Plaintiff Todo	0.10	45.00	RBI
	Receipt and by Stephen V	review of Notice V. Grace.	of Appearance	0.10	45.00	RBI
Sep-01-10	Receipt and stating bar stating bar stating and active.	review of docket atus of Stephen	t text from clerk Grace is verified	0.10	45.00	RBI

	Case5:10-md-02188-RMW Document81-2 Filed0	09/24/12	Page24 of 27	
Invoice #:	5573 Page 4		April 27,	2012
Sep-13-10	Receipt and review of Noticve of Presentation or Waiver of Oral Argument by Daniel Ward.	0.10	45.00	RBI
	Draft and file Notice of Presentation or Waiver of Oral Argument by Brent Irby.	0.20	90.00	RBİ
Sep-16-10	Receipt and review of Motion to Withdraw Apperanance by Trevor Howell.	0.10	45.00	RBI
Sep-20-10	Receipt and review of Order granting Motion to Withdraw Appearance by Trevor Howell.	0.10	45.00	RBI
Oct-11-10	Receipt and review of transfer order.	0.10	45.00	RBI
	Receipt and review of Transfer Order; receipt and review of order stating case remains stayed and a case management conference that is scheduled for October 7, 2010 has been continued.	0.10	45.00	RBI
Nov-15-10	Receipt and review of certified copy of transfer order.	0.10	45.00	RBI
Nov-17-10	Receipt and review of Clerk's notice advising counsel of acknowledgment and receipt of case.	0.10	45.00	RBI
	Receipt and review of pleading stating case has been transferred.	0.10	45.00	RBI
Dec-02-10	Receipt and review of Joint Stipulation Extending Time to Respond to Complaint.	0.00	0.00	RBI
Dec-15-10	Receipt and review of pleading regarding case being reassigned to Magistrate Judge Paul Grewal for discovery purposes.	0.10	45.00	RBI
Jan-19-11	Receipt and review of Stipulation and Pretrial Order No. 1.	0.10	45.00	RBI
	Receipt and review of Motion to Withdraw as Attorney by C. Meade Hartfield.	0.10	45.00	RBI
Jan-21-11	Receipt and review of Order granting Defendant's Motion to Withdraw as Attorney.	0.10	45.00	RBI
Feb-22-11	Receipt and review of Change of Address for Meade Hartfield.	0.10	45.00	RBI
Feb-20-12	Receipt and review of Order granting Conditional Certification of	0.20	90.00	RBĪ

у	Case5:10-md-02188-RMW	Doo	cument81-2	Filed09/24/12	•	
Invoice #:	5573 I	Page	5		A	pril 27, 2012
	Settlement Class and Preli Settlement Agreement and	imina I Rele	ry Approval of ease.	f		
Feb-22-12	Conference with client reg	gardin	g settlement.	1.20	540.00	RBI
Apr-19-12	Receipt and review of lett Howell with invoice for so	er fro ervice	m Trevor es.	0.10	45.00	RBI
	Totals			21.60	\$9,720.00	
DISBURS	EMENTS					67
	Filing Fee				350.00	
Jul-31-10	Photocopy Expense				3.75	
	Postage Expense				20.08	
Aug-31-10					127.50	
Sep-01-10	_				1.97	
Sep-30-10					10.75	
. 1	Interest				2.14	
Oct-31-10	Photocopy Expense				1.50	
Nov-11-10	~ -				2.08	
Nov-19-10				2.11		
Nov-30-10					1.00	
Dec-22-10	- · ·				2.34	
Dec-31-10					3.75	
Jan-27-11	Interest				2.43	
Feb-15-11	Interest				2.01	
Feb-28-11	Photocopy Expense				5.75	
Mar-04-11					1.89	
Apr-06-11					1.89	
May-03-1					1.98	
Jun-21-11					2.18	
Jul-13-11	Interest				1.23	
Aug-10-1	1 Interest				2.30	
Sep-28-11					2.21	
Oct-24-11					2.16	
Dec-22-11					2.14	
Jan-13-12					2.38	
Feb-17-12					1.71	
Feb-29-12					15.25	
Mar-14-1	-				2.14	
112WA A 1 A				-		
	Totals				\$578.62	

Total Fee & Disbursements

\$10,298.62

Case5:10-md-02188-RMW Document81-2 Filed09/24/12 Page26 of 27

Invoice #: 5573 Page 6

April 27, 2012

Balance Now Due

\$10,298.62

TAX ID Number

20-2162092

TREVOR W. HOWELL ATTORNEY AT LAW

The Pinnacle at Symphony Place 150 Third Avenue South, 17th Floor Nashville, Tennessee 37201 Telephone (615) 244-4994 Facsimile (615) 256-6339 thowell@gsrm.com

VIA E-MAIL

McCallum, Hoaglund, Cook & Irby, LLP 905 Montgomery Highway, Suite 201 Vestavia Hills, AL 35216

April 19, 2012 Page: 1 Invoice No. 11953

Re: David C. Purdue v. Apple, Inc.

U.S. District Court, Middle District of Tennessee

Civil Action No. 3:10-0687

For professional services rendered between July 15, 2010, and September 17, 2010:

Telephone conferences and e-mail transmissions by and between Brent Irby, Esq., and TWH; draft and file Notice of Appearance as local counsel; monitor pleadings and correspondence and file Notice of Withdrawal as local counsel.

PLEASE RETURN THIS STATEMENT COVER WITH YOUR PAYMENT MADE PAYABLE TO TREVOR W. HOWELL, ATTORNEY AT LAW,

TO ENSURE PROPER CREDIT TO YOUR ACCOUNT THANK YOU.