10/08/2008 11:52 IFAX → Barbara ② 001/010

Case 2:00-md-01355-EEF-KWR Document 3999-1 Filed 10/08/09 Page 1 of 10

JUNEAU DAVID

P.O. Drawer 51 268 Lafayette, LA 70505-1268 Tax ID 72-1250097

October 6, 2009

Invoice #: 19648

Billed Through: September 30, 2009

Account #: 001300 00533

RE: IN RE: PROPULSID PRODUCTS LIABILITY LITIGATION

DOCKET NUMBER: MDL NO.1355

FILE NUMBER: 1300-533

PROPULSID I RESOLUTION PROGRAM

CURRENT FEES THROUGH: September 30, 2009 \$31,145.50

CURRENT EXPENSES THROUGH: September 30, 2009 \$2,466.10

TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS BILL \$33,611.60

TOTAL DUE THIS INVOICE \$33,611.60

PLEASE INCLUDE INVOICE NO. ON YOUR CHECK.

** PAYABLE UPON RECEIPT**



10/08/2009 11:52 IFAK → Barbara **2** 002/010

JUNEAU DAVID

P.O. Drawer 51268 Lafayette, LA 70505-1268 Tax ID 72-1250097

October 6, 2009

Invoice #: 19648

Billed through: September 30, 2009 PROPULSID I RESOLUTION PROGRAM

001300 00533 Account #:

RE: IN RE: PROPULSID PRODUCTS LIABILITY LITIGATION

DOCKET NUMBER: MDL NO.1355

FILE NUMBER: 1300-533

PROFESS	SIONAL	SERVICES	Hours
07/01/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM CLAIMS STAFF, DIRECTED TO TRACIE MILITANO, PROVIDING INFORMATION ON CERTAIN ADMINISTRATIVE CLAIMS	0.20
07/02/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAILS FROM JUDGE FALLON'S OFFICE AND MONIQUE GARSAUD REGARDING RULE TO SHOW CAUSE PERTAINING TO SHAFFER CLAIM AND GRANTING OF SAME	0.20
07/02/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM LENNY DAVIS REGARDING ORDER PERTAINING TO HIPAA AUTHORIZATIONS AND DISCUSSING SAME	0.10
07/02/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM DANNY CLAVIER REGARDING ISSUANCE OF DENIED TIER CHECKS	0,20
07/02/09	PAJ	TELEPHONE CALL TO LENNY DAVIS	0.10
07/02/09	PAJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MONIQUE GARSAUD REGARDING STATUS OF PANEL ORIENTATION	0.30
07/02/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM DANNY CLAVIER FORWARDING INTERIM STATEMENT FOR SERVICES THROUGH JUNE 30, 2009	0.30
07/02/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE SETTING HEARING AT 9:00 A.M. ON JULY 8, 2009	0.10
07/02/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM CLAIMS STAFF PROVIDING UPDATED NUMBERS ON CLAIMS	0.10
07/02/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM MONIQUE GARSAUD FORWARDING COPY OF CORRESPONDENCE SENT TO COUNSEL FOR DALE SHAFFER CONCERNING ORDER ON RULE TO SHOW CAUSE	0.20
07/02/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM LENNY DAVIS INQUIRING INTO WHETHER OR NOT THE PSC SHOULD ATTEND THE SHOW CAUSE HEARING	0.10
07/02/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF SUBSEQUENT EMAIL FROM MONIQUE GARSAUD INQUIRING AS TO WHETHER OR NOT EITHER THE PSC OR DEFENDANTS NEED TO ATTEND THE SHOW CAUSE HEARING	0.10
07/02/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF MINUTE ENTRY FROM JUNE 26, 2009 STATUS CONFERENCE	0.30
07/02/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM MONIQUE GARSAUD REGARDING DR. THORNTON'S AVAILABILITY FOR PANEL ORIENTATION	0.20
07/02/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM MONIQUE GARSAUD REGARDING BEO CLAIM AND PROVIDING STIPULATION AND DISMISSAL FILED PERTAINING TO SAME	0.30

Case 2:00-md-01355-EEF-KWR Document 3999-1 Filed 10/08/09 Page 3 of 10

001300	00533	Invoice # 19648 Page	2
07/06/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF SUBSEQUENT EMAIL FROM MONIQUE GARSAUD CONFIRMING JUDGE FALLON'S AVAILABILITY FOR PANEL ORIENTATION ON JULY 8, 2009	0.10
07/06/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM CLAIM STAFF, DIRECTED TO WENDY POMERANTZ, REGARDING CASSATT CLAIM AND SUBMISSION OF EXPERT REPORTS	0.30
07/06/09	РАЈ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM MARK SLEDGE'S OFFICE REGARDING MEDICAL RECORDS SUBMITTED ON BEHALF OF REC ID 4331, REC ID 3776 AND REC ID 4291	0.30
07/06/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM CLAIMS STAFF FORWARDING VARIOUS AUTHORIZATIONS FOR RELEASE OF RECORDS	0.70
07/06/09	PAJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MONIQUE GARSAUD	0.40
07/07/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM CHARLES PREUSS REGARDING CASSATT MATTER AND SUBMISSION OF EXPERT REPORTS AND SAME IN RELATION TO THE TERM SHEET	0.20
07/07/09	PAJ	EMAIL TO LENNY DAVIS REGARDING RULE TO SHOW CAUSE HEARING	0.10
07/07/09	РАЈ	TRAVEL TO NEW ORLEANS, CONFERENCE WITH STAFF AND REVIEWING PLAINTIFF AND DEFENSE MEMORANDUMS TO BE SUBMITTED TO PANEL	5.80
07/08/09	PAJ	COURT APPEARANCE BEFORE JUDGE FALLON REGARDING SHAFFER MATTER, ORIENTATION PROCESS FOR NEW MEDICAL PANEL MEMBER AND SUBSEQUENT CONFERENCE WITH NEW MEDICAL PANEL MEMBER	850
07/09/09	РАЈ	REVIEWING PLAINTIFF AND DEFENDANT MEMORANDUM, PREPARATION OF MOTION WITH PROPOSED ORDER RELATING TO HIPPA RELEASES AND RETURN TO LAFAYETTE	7.50
07/10/09	РАJ	REVIEW OF MINUTE ENTRY REGARDING SHAFFER CLAIM	0.10
07/10/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM CLAIMS STAFF REGARDING CASSATT MATTER	0.20
07/10/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF MINUTE ENTRY PERTAINING TO RULE TO SHOW CAUSE HEARING	0.10
07/10/09	PAJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH TOM CAMPION'S OFFICE REGARDING SUBMISSIONS	0.30
07/10/09	PAJ	PREPARATION OF MOTION AND ORDER FOR PAYMENT OF FEES AND EXPENSES INCURRED BY SPECIAL MASTER AND CLAIMS ADMINISTRATOR	0.40
07/13/09	PAJ	EMAIL TO CLAIMS STAFF REGARDING TIER CASES	0.10
07/13/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF INVOICE FROM CURATOR BOB JOHNSTON FOR SERVICES THROUGH JUNE 30, 2009	0.20
07/13/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM CHARLES PREUSS REGARDING SUBMISSIONS AND MEDICAL EXPERT REPORTS	0.10
07/13/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM CLAIMS STAFF, DIRECTED TO ATTORNEY INGRAM, REGARDING REC ID 49521 AND PROVIDING DETERMINATION PAGES FOR SAME	0.20
07/13/09	PAJ	EMAIL TO CHARLES PREUSS REGARDING MEDICAL EXPERT REPORTS	0.30
07/13/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM CLAIMS STAFF, DIRECTED TO DANNY CLAVIER, FORWARDING INVOICES TO BE PAID	0.20
07/14/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM CLAIMS STAFF REGARDING TIER CLAIMS	0.30

Case 2:00-md-01355-EEF-KWR Document 3999-1 Filed 10/08/09 Page 4 of 10

001300	00533	Invoice # 19648 Page	3
		AND PROVIDING BREAKDOWN OF SAME	
07/14/09	PAJ	CONFERENCE CALL WITH TOM CAMPION AND CHARLES PREUSS	0,60
07/14/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF SIGNED PRETRIAL ORDER RELATING TO MEDICAL AUTHORIZATION FORMS	0.10
07/14/09	PAJ	PREPARATION OF MOTION AND ORDER FOR APPROVAL OF COURT APPOINTED CURATOR'S INVOICE	0,30
07/14/09	PAJ	CONFERENCE WITH STAFF IN NEW ORLEANS AND REVISING PROCEDURES REGARDING HANDLING OF CLAIMS	6.50
07/15/09	PAJ	CONTINUED MEETING WITH STAFF AT SPECIAL MASTER'S OFFICE, REVIEWING PLAINTIFF AND DEFENSE MEMORANDUM ON CASES TO BE SUBMITTED TO MEDICAL PANEL AND RETURN TO LAFAYETTE	8.50
07/16/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAILS FROM LESLIE RAST FORWARDING ADMINISTRATIVE EXPENSE CHECKS FOR APPROVAL AND SIGNATURE	0.30
07/16/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM CLAIMS STAFF FORWARDING BATCHES OF CLAIMS CLEARED FOR EXPEDITED BRIEFING	0.10
07/16/09	PAJ	EMAIL TO ATTORNEY CORY AND CHARLES PREUSS REGARDING SUBMISSIONS	0.20
07/16/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM EMAIL FROM RUSS HERMAN'S OFFICE REGARDING CLAIMS OF SMITH AND CLINTON AND PROVIDING COPIES OF CORRESPONDENCE RELATING TO EACH CLAIM	0.40
07/16/09	PAR	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH CLAIMS STAFF REGARDING CASES TO PANEL	0,20
07/17/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM CLAIMS STAFF REGARDING NEW MOTION AND AUTHORIZATIONS FOR RELEASE OF RECORDS	0.20
07/20/09	PAJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH DANNY CLAVIER REGARDING CONTRACTUAL ARRANGEMENTS WITH CONTRACT EMPLOYEE	0.20
07/20/09	PAR	EMAIL TO DANNY CLAVIER REGARDING MAILING OF ADMINISTRATIVE EXPENSE CHECKS	0,10
07/21/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM DANNY CLAVIER REGARDING CONTRACT EMPLOYEES	0.20
07/21/09	PAJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH CLAIMS STAFF REGARDING CLIAMANT INQUIRY	0.40
07/21/09	PAJ	PREPARING CONTRACT FOR OUTSIDE CONTRACT EMPLOYEE	1.00
07/21/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM LESLIE RAST, DIRECTED TO DEUTSCHE BANK, REGARDING RELEASE OF CHECKS	0.10
07/23/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM CLAIMS STAFF PROVIDING UPDATED NUMBERS ON CLAIMS TO PANEL	0.10
07/23/09	РАЈ	REVIEW OF SUBSEQUENT EMAIL FROM CLAIMS STAFF REGARDING CLAIMS TO PANEL FOR REVIEW	0.20
07/23/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM CLAIMS STAFF REGARDING PRO SE INFORMATION AND PROVIDING SPREADSHEET CONCERNING SAME	0.30
07/24/09	PAJ	EMAIL TO CLAIMS STAFF REGARDING CASES TO BE BRIEFED BY THE DEFENSE	0.20
07/24/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF ORDER APPROVING PAYMENT OF STATEMENTS OF SPECIAL MASTER AND CLAIMS ADMINISTRATOR	0.10
07/24/09	PAJ	EMAIL TO DANNY CLAVIER FORWARDING ORDER APPROVING PAYMENT OF STATEMENTS OF SPECIAL MASTER AND CLAIMS ADMINISTRATOR	0,10
07/27/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAILS FROM LESLIE RAST FORWARDING	0.30

00 1300	00533	Invoice # 19648 Page	4
		ADMINISTRATIVE EXPENSE CHECKS FOR APPROVAL AND SIGNATURE	
07/27/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF ORDER APPROVING PAYMENT OF CURATOR'S INVOICE	0.10
07/27/09	PAJ	EMAIL TO DANNY CLAVIER FORWARDING ORDER APPROVING	0.10
		PAYMENT OF CURATOR'S INVOICE	
07/27/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM CLAIMS STAFF REGARDING PROCESSING OF EXPEDITED CASES	0.20
07/27/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM CLAIMS STAFF FORWARDING BATCHES OF CLAIMS CLEARED FOR BRIEFING	0.10
07/28/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF JOINT REPORT NO. 76 OF PLAINTIFFS AND DEFENDANTS	0.30
07/28/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM CLAIMS STAFF PROVIDING FILED DOCUMENTS PERTAINING TO REC ID 49867	0.20
07/29/09	PAJ	PARTICIPATION IN TELEPHONE STATUS CONFERENCE WITH JUDGE FALLON AND PARTIES	0.50
07/29/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAILS FROM CLAIMS STAFF AND DANNY CLAVIER REGARDING ISSUANCE OF AWARD PAYMENT FOR REC ID 49867	0.20
07/29/09	РАЈ	EXTENSIVE TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ANGIE REGARDING CLAIMS TO PANEL, PROCESSING OF SAME AND CLAIMS WAITING FOR REVIEW	0.80
07/29/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM TRACIE MILITANO REGARDING RECEIPT OF REQUIRED DOCUMENTS FOR REC ID 49867 AND PROVIDING PAYMENT DETAILS FOR ISSUANCE OF CHECK ON SAME	0.30
07/29/09	РАЈ	REVIEW OF VARIOUS EMAILS FROM TRACIE MILITANO AND LENNY DAVIS PERTAINING TO RELEASE DOCUMENT AND FUNDS FOR REC ID 49867	0.60
07/29/09	PAJ	PREPARATION OF CORRESPONDENCE TO DEUTSCHE BANK AUTHORIZING TRANSFER OF FUNDS FOR PAYMENT OF AWARD ON REC ID 49867	0. 20
07/29/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM CLAIMS STAFF PROVIDING UPDATED NUMBERS ON CLAIMS TO PANEL, PANEL REVIEW HOURS AND BREAKDOWN OF TIER CLAIMS	0.30
07/29/09	PAJ	EMAIL TO CLAIMS STAFF REGARDING CANCELLING WEEKLY CONFERENCE CALL SET FOR TOMORROW	0.20
07/29/09	PAJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH CLAIMS STAFF REGARDING CASES TO PANEL, REVIEW OF CLAIMS, MEDICAL REPORTING AND GENERAL STATUS	0.50
07/31/09	PAJ	REVIEWING AT SPECIAL MASTER'S OFFICE PLAINTIFFS AND DEFENSE MEMORANDUMS TO BE SUBMITTED TO PANEL AND WORKING ON SCHEDULE REGARDING PANEL CONSIDERATIONS	3,00
07/31/09	PAR	EMAIL TO DANNY CLAVIER REGARDING MAILING OF ADMINISTRATIVE EXPENSE CHECKS	0.10
08/04/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM DANNY CLAVIER REGARDING ISSUANCE OF SETTLEMENT CHECK	0.10
08/04/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM LESLIE RAST, DIRECTED TO DEUTSCHE BANK, REGARDING RELEASE OF CHECKS	0.10
08/04/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM MONIQUE GARSAUD REGARDING MEDICAL PANEL	0.20
08/04/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM LESLIE RAST FORWARDING ADMINISTRATIVE EXPENSE CHECKS FOR APPROVAL AND SIGNATURE	0.30

Case 2:00-md-01355-EEF-KWR Document 3999-1 Filed 10/08/09 Page 6 of 10

001300	00533	Invoice # 19648 Page	5
08/05/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM LENNY DAVIS REGARDING PANEL MEMBER	0.10
08/05/09	PAJ	EMAIL TO MONIQUE GARSAUD AND LENNY DAVIS REGARDING PANEL MEMBER	0.10
08/05/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM MONIQUE GARSAUD REGARDING PANEL MEMBER	0.20
08/05/09	PAJ	EMAIL TO MONIQUE GARSAUD REGARDING SELECTION OF PANEL MEMBER	0.20
08/05/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF MINUTE ENTRY REGARDING THE JULY 29, 2009 STATUS CONFERENCE	0.30
08/06/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM CLAIMS STAFF PROVIDING UPDATED NUMBERS ON CLAIMS	0.20
08/07/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM CLAIMS STAFF, DIRECTED TO TRACIE MILITANO, REGARDING BRIEFS ON EXPEDITED CLAIMS	0.10
08/07/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM TRACIE MILITANO REGARDING BRIEFS ON EXPEDITED CLAIMS	0.10
08/10/09	PAJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH CLAIMS STAFF REGARDING CASES REVIEWED	0.30
08/10/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM CLAIMS STAFF FORWARDING W-9 FORM AND INVOICE FOR SERVICES OF KAREN ZITO, INDEPENDENT CONTRACTOR	0.20
08/11/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM LESLIE RAST FORWARDING PANEL INVOICES APPROVED FOR PAYMENT AND AUTHORIZING WIRING OF FUNDS FOR SAME	0.30
08/11/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM LESLIE RAST, DIRECTED TO DEUTSCHE BANK, REGARDING RELEASE OF CHECKS	0.10
08/11/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAILS FROM LESLIE RAST FORWARDING ADMINISTRATIVE EXPENSE CHECKS FOR APPROVAL AND SIGNATURE	0.20
08/11/09	PAJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH CLAIMS STAFF REGARDING BRIEFS RECEIVED AND UPDATE ON PANEL CONSIDERATIONS	0.40
08/13/09	PAJ	TRAVEL TO NEW ORLEANS, CONFERENCE WITH STAFF AND REVIEWING FILES LACKING MEDICAL RECORDS	5.50
08/14/09	PAJ	REVIEWING FILES REGARDING MEDICAL RECORDS AND MEMORANDAS AT CLAIMS OFFICE AND RETURN TO LAFAYETIE	00.8
08/15/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM JAMES IRWIN PROVIDING RESUME OF PANEL NOMINEE, DR. SAMIR PATEL	0.30
08/17/09	PAR	EMAIL TO DANNY CLAVIER REGARDING MAILING OF ADMINISTRATIVE EXPENSE CHECKS	0.10
08/18/09	PAJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH TOM CAMPION	0.30
08/18/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM LESLIE RAST, DIRECTED TO DEUTSCHE BANK, REGARDING RELEASE OF CHECKS	0.10
08/19/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM CLAIMS STAFF, DIRECTED TO COUNSEL, PROVIDING NUMBERS ON CLAIMS AS OF AUGUST 13, 2009	0.10
08/19/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF PLAINTIFFS AND DEFENDANTS JOINT REPORT NO. 77	0.30
08/19/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM LENNY DAVIS, DIRECTED TO TOM CAMPION AND CHUCK PREUSS, REGARDING OGLESBY CLAIM AND MEDICAL RECORDS REQUESTED PERTAINING TO SAME	0.30
08/19/09	PAJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH CLAIMS STAFF REGARDING CLAIMS TO PANEL	0.30

Case 2:00-md-01355-EEF-KWR Document 3999-1 Filed 10/08/09 Page 7 of 10

001300	00533	Invoice # 19648 Page	6
08/19/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM CHUCK PREUSS REGARDING OGLESBY CLAIM AND REVIEW OF SAME	0.20
08/20/09	PAJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH COURT AND PARTIES	0.30
08/20/09	PAJ	EMAIL TO TOM CAMPION REGARDING EXPEDITING CLAIMS	0.10
08/20/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM CLAIMS STAFF PROVIDING NUMBERS ON CLAIMS TO ALL PARTIES AS OF AUGUST 19, 2009	0.10
08/20/09	PAJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH CLAIMS STAFF	0.30
08/20/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM CLAIMS STAFF PROVIDING UPDATED NUMBERS ON CLAIMS AS OF AUGUST 19, 2009, STATUS OF SCHEDULED REVIEWS BY PANEL MEMBERS AND CLAIMS WITH NO MED RECORDS	0.30
08/20/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM CLAIMS STAFF REGARDING CLAIMS CLEARED FOR EXPEDITED BRIEFING AND FORWARDING BATCHES OF SAME	0.20
08/21/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM FRED LONGER REGARDING NUMBERS ON CLAIMS AND PROVIDING SAME TO JUDGE FALLON	0.10
08/21/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM LENNY DAVIS REGARDING NUMBERS TO JUDGE FALLON AND REQUESTING A CONFERENCE CALL NEXT WEEK	0.20
08/21/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF MINUTE ENTRY REGARDING THE AUGUST 20, 2009 STATUS CONFERENCE	0.30
08/24/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF INVOICE FROM CURATOR BOB JOHNSTON FOR SERVICES THROUGH JULY 31, 2009	0.20
08/24/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAILS FROM CLAIMS STAFF FORWARDING BATCHES OF CLAIMS CLEARED FOR BRIEFING	0.20
08/24/09	РАЈ	EMAIL TO JUDGE FALLON PROVIDING CURRENT NUMBERS ON CLAIMS	0.10
08/25/09	PAJ	PREPARATION OF MOTION AND ORDER TO APPROVE CURATOR'S INVOICE FOR SERVICES THROUGH JULY 31, 2009	0.30
08/26/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF ORDER APPROVING PAYMENT OF CURATOR'S INVOICE	0.10
08/26/09	PAJ	EMAIL TO DANNY CLAVIER FORWARDING ORDER APPROVING CURATOR'S INVOICE	0.10
08/26/09	PAJ	CONFERENCE WITH STAFF AND REVIEWING CLAIMANT AND DEFENSE MEMORANDUM AT CLAIMS OFFICE IN NEW ORLEANS	8.00
08/27/09	PAJ	CONTINUED REVIEW OF MEMORANDUM, REVIEW CLAIMS CONSIDERED FOR DISMISSAL UNDER PROVISIONS OF TERM SHEET AND RETURN TO LAFAYETTE	6.50
08/28/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM CHARLES PREUSS REGARDING PANELIST REVIEW OF CLAIMS	0.20
08/28/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM RUSS HERMAN REGARDING PANELIST REVIEW OF CLAIMS AND STATUS OF SELECTING NEW PANEL MEMBER	0.30
08/28/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM LENNY DAVIS ADVISING THAT THE PLAINTIFFS ACCEPT DR. PATEL AS A PANEL MEMBER	0.10
09/01/09	PAJ	EMAIL TO CHUCK PREUSS REGARDING REVIEW OF EXPEDITED CLAIMS BY PANELIST	0.30
09/01/09	PAJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH CLAIMS STAFF REGARDING STATUS OF REVIEWS	0.50
09/02/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM CLAIMS STAFF, DIRECTED TO PARTIES, REGARDING TIER CLAIMS WITH NO MEDICAL RECORDS AND PROVIDING DRAFT REPORT OF SAME	0.40

Case 2:00-md-01355-EEF-KWR Document 3999-1 Filed 10/08/09 Page 8 of 10

001300	00533	Invoice # 19648 Page	7
09/02/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM CLAIMS STAFF, DIRECTED TO TRACIE MILITANO, REGARDING DISMISSAL OF CLAIMS AND INTENTIONS OF FILING A MOTION AND ORDER PERTAINING TO SAME	0.30
09/03/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM CHUCK PREUSS REGARDING PANEL REVIEW OF EXPEDITED CLAIMS	0.20
09/03/09	РАЈ	EMAIL TO LENNY DAVIS REGARDING REVIEW OF EXPEDITED CLAIMS	0.10
09/03/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAILS FROM LESLIE RAST FORWARDING ADMINISTRATIVE EXPENSE CHECKS FOR APPROVAL AND SIGNATURE	0.30
09/03/09	РАЈ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM CLAIMS STAFF PROVIDING UPDATED REPORT ON CLAIMS	0.20
09/03/09	PAJ	EMAIL TO PARTIES PROVIDING UPDATED NUMBERS ON CLAIMS	0.10
09/03/09	PAJ	CONFERENCE CALL WITH ALL PARTIES	0.40
09/08/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM CLAIMS STAFF, DIRECTED TO CARROLL INGRAM, REGARDING REC ID 32098 AND PROVIDING DETERMINATION OF ELIGIBILITY LETTER FOR SAME	0.20
09/09/09	PAJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH CLAIMS STAFF REGARDING EXPEDITED CLAIMS AND REPORTS	0.50
09/14/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM MONIQUE GARSAUD REGARDING PANEL TRAINING FOR DR. PATEL AND PROVIDING AVAILABLE DATES FOR SAME	0.20
09/14/09	PAJ	EMAIL TO MONIQUE GARSAUD PROVIDING AVAILABILITY FOR PANEL TRAINING	0.10
09/14/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM FRED LONGER REGARDING AVAILABILITY FOR PANEL TRAINING	0.10
09/14/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM LENNY DAVIS REGARDING PANEL TRAINING	0.10
09/14/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM MONIQUE GARSAUD INQUIRING INTO AVAILABILITY FOR PANEL TRAINING ON SEFTEMBER 29, 2009	0.10
09/14/09	PAJ	EMAIL TO MONIQUE GARSAUD ADVISING OF AVAILABILITY FOR PANEL TRAINING ON SEPTEMBER 29, 2009	0.10
09/15/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM MONIQUE GARSAUD CONFIRMING PANEL TRAINING FOR 3:00 P.M. ON SETEPMBER 29, 2009 IN NEW ORLEANS	0.10
09/15/09	PAJ	CONFERENCE WITH STAFF AT CLAIMS OFFICE AND REVIEWING MEMORANDUM OF SUBMITTED CLAIMS	5.00
09/17/09	PAJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PARTIES	0.40
09/18/09	PAJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH TOM CAMPION REGARDING AGREEMENT ON PANEL DETERMINATIONS	0.30
09/18/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF ORDER CHANGING TIME OF STATUS CONFERENCE SET FOR SEPTEMBER 24, 2009	0.10
09/21/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAILS FROM LESLIE RAST FORWARDING ADMINISTRATIVE EXPENSE CHECKS FOR APPROVAL AND SIGNATURE	0.30
09/22/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF JOINT REPORT NO. 78 OF PLAINTIFFS AND DEFENDANTS AND PROPOSED AGENDA FOR UPCOMING STATUS CONFERENCE	0.30
09/22/09	рај	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM CLAIMS STAFF PROVIDING UPDATED NUMBERS ON CLAIMS IN VIEW OF UPCOMING STATUS CONFERENCE	0.20
09/23/09	PAJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH CLAIMS STAFF REGARDING CLAIMS AND STATUS	0.50

1●/●9/2●●8 11:53 IFAX → Barbara 🙋 ●●9/●1●

Case 2:00-md-01355-EEF-KWR Document 3999-1 Filed 10/08/09 Page 9 of 10

001300	00533			Invoice # 1964	8 Page	8
09/23/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAILS FROM CLAIMS STAFF AND TRACIE MILITANO REGARDING OUTSTANDING ISSUES AND PROVIDING PREVIOUSLY SUBMITTED DOCUMENTS TO COMPLETE SAME				0.60
09/24/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM LESI INVOICES APPROVED FOR PAY		VARDING PHY	SICIAN	0.30
09/24/09	PAJ	PARTICIPATION IN TELEPHON AND PARTIES	E STATUS CON	NFERENCE WI	TH COURT	0.30
09/25/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF MINUTE ENTRY RISTATUS CONFERENCE	EGARDING TH	E SEPTEMBER	24, 2009	0.30
09/25/09	PAR	EMAIL TO DANNY CLAVIER RI ADMINISTRATIVE EXPENSE C		AILING OF		0.10
09/28/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM CLAR REGARDING DOCUMENTS FILE		RECTED TO CO	OURT,	0.10
09/28/09	PAJ	CONFERENCE WITH STAFF AN CLAIMS OFFICE	D REVIEWING	MEMORANDU	J M AT	6,80
09/29/09	PAJ	CONTINUED REVIEW OF MEMO MEDICAL PANEL ORIENTATIO NEW PANEL MEMBER AND RE	N, SUBSEQUEI	NT CONFEREN		10.00
09/29/09	PAR	EMAIL TO CLAIMS STAFF REG RECEIVED ON AUDREY JOHNS		CAL RECORDS	3	0.10
09/30/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM CLAIC CLAIMS FOR EXPEDITED BRIE		RWARDING BA	TCHES OF	0.10
09/30/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM CLA CLAIMS CLEARED FOR FULL E		RWARDING BA	ATCH OF	0.10
09/30/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM TRACOUTSTANDING BRIEFS	CIE MILITANO	REGARDING		0.10
09/30/09	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM CLAITERED CLAIMS AND PROVIDE				0.20
						\$31,145.50
PAJ	JUNEAU.	PATRICK A.	124.40 hrs @	\$250.00 /hr	\$31,100.00	
PAR	PARALE		0.70 hrs @	\$65.00 /hr	\$45.50	
	Fee Recap	o Totals	125.10		\$31,145.50	

	Fee Recap Totals	125.10	\$31,145.50
EXPENS	ES		Amount
07/07/09	PATRICK A WINEAU W. PARKING NEW C	DI FANCIA	10.00

07/07/09	PATRICK A JUNEAU, JR; PARKING - NEW ORLEANS, LA	10.00
07/07/09	PATRICK A JUNEAU, JR; MILEAGE - NEW ORLEANS, LA	165.00
07/07/09	PATRICK A JUNEAU, JR; MEALS - NEW ORLEANS, LA	37.90
07/08/09	PATRICK A JUNEAU, JR; PARKING - NEW ORLEANS, LA	10.00
07/08/09	PATRICK A JUNEAU, JR; MEALS WITH STAFF - NEW ORLEANS,	69.16
	LA	
07/08/09	PATRICK A JUNEAU, JR; MEALS - NEW ORLEANS, LA	24.90
07/09/09	PATRICK A JUNEAU, JR; HOTEL - NEW ORLEANS, LA	218.94
07/09/09	PATRICK A JUNEAU, JR; MEALS - NEW ORLEANS, LA	32.73
07/14/09	PATRICK A JUNEAU, JR; HOTEL - NEW ORLEANS, LA	109.47
07/14/09	PATRICK A JUNEAU, JR; MILEAGE - NEW ORLEANS, LA	165.00
07/14/09	PATRICK A JUNEAU, JR; MEALS - NEW ORLEANS, LA	31.95

1●/●9/2●●8 11:53 IFAX → Barbara 🕢 ●1●/●1●

Case 2:00-md-01355-EEF-KWR Document 3999-1 Filed 10/08/09 Page 10 of 10

001300	00533	Invoice # 19648	Page	9
07/15/09	PATRICK A JUNEAU, JR; MEALS - NEW ORLEANS, LA			29.65
07/16/09	A T & T; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE HELD 6/01/09			135.95
07/16/09	A T & T; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE HELD 06/23/09			62.09
07/31/09	PATRICK A JUNEAU, JR; MEALS - NEW ORLEANS, LA			53.20
08/04/09	FEDERAL EXPRESS; DELIVERY SERVICE/MESSENGERS	}		18.01
08/13/09	PATRICK A JUNEAU, JR; MILEAGE - NEW ORLEANS, LA	<u>.</u>		165.00
08/13/09	PATRICK A JUNEAU, JR; MEALS - NEW ORLEANS, LA			24.96
08/14/09	PATRICK A JUNEAU, JR; HOTEL - NEW ORLEANS, LA			109.47
08/14/09	PATRICK A JUNEAU, JR; MEALS - NEW ORLEANS, LA			36.50
08/26/09	PATRICK A JUNEAU, JR; MEALS - NEW ORLEANS, LA			28.60
08/26/09	PATRICK A JUNEAU, JR; MEAL WITH STAFF - NEW ORL	EANS, LA		58.54
08/27/09	PATRICK A JUNEAU, JR; MILEAGE - NEW ORLEANS, LA	1		165.00
08/27/09	PATRICK A JUNEAU, JR; HOTEL - NEW ORLEANS, LA			109.47
08/27/09	PATRICK A JUNEAU, JR; MEALS - NEW ORLEANS, LA			24.84
09/28/09	PATRICK A JUNEAU, JR; MILEGE - NEW ORLEANS, LA			165.00
09/28/09	PATRICK A JUNEAU, JR; MEALS - NEW ORLEANS, LA			36.50
09/29/09	PATRICK A JUNEAU, JR; HOTEL - NEW ORLEANS, LA			109.47
09/29/09	PATRICK A JUNEAU, JR; MEALS - NEW ORLEANS, LA			34.95
09/30/09	COPYING			75.19
09/30/09	LONG DISTANCE TELEPHONE CHARGE			128.78
09/30/09	POSTAGE CHARGE			19.88
				\$2,466.10

Expense Recap Totals \$2,466.10

BILLING SUMMARY:

TOTAL FEES	\$31,145.50
TOTAL EXPENSES	\$2,466.10
TOTAL FEES & EXPENSES	\$33,611.60
TOTAL DUE THIS INVOICE	\$33,611,60